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“For a nation that is afraid to let its people judge the truth and falsehood in an open market is a 

nation that is afraid of its people.” 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

President John F. Kennedy 

(February 26, 1962)  
 

January 6, 2026 
 

To the Citizens of Nebraska: 
 

Being honored to serve as Nebraska’s Auditor of Public Accounts, I have striven to safeguard public funds at all 

levels of government, exposing countless incidents, large and small, of misuse or misappropriation (i.e., theft) of 

taxpayer dollars.  This is the foremost of my office’s many important responsibilities, and it is spurred by the 

certainty that every penny in a governmental treasury comes, one way or another, from the pocket of a hardworking 

citizen – someone who may be struggling to make ends meet in these uncertain economic times but must pay a 

plethora of State and local taxes nonetheless.   
 

Dedicated to pursuing aggressively any indication of possible governmental waste, fraud, and abuse regardless of 

secondary considerations, I am presenting herein the details of a multimillion-dollar contract between the Nebraska 

Department of Economic Development (Department) and Global Sustainability Developers, LLC (GSD).  That 

contract was awarded in 2024 pursuant to legislation passed merely a month earlier for the express purpose of 

assisting the State with growing its bioeconomy industry over the course of one year.  In addition to falling within 

the purview of my office’s audit of the Annual Comprehensive Financial Report (ACFR) for the State of Nebraska, 

the expenditure of public funds occasioned by the agreement has been the subject of serious concerns shared with 

me and my staff by citizens across the state.  
  

The Nebraska Supreme Court has emphasized the importance of competitive bidding when awarding public 

contracts: 
 

At the outset we acknowledge that competitive bidding, after public advertising, is a fundamental, time-honored 

procedure that assures the prudent expenditure of public money. . . . Competitive bid statutes exist to invite 

competition, to guard against favoritism, improvidence, extravagance, fraud, and corruption, and to secure the best 

work or supplies at the lowest possible price. Such statutes are enacted for the benefit of taxpayers.1 

 

(Emphasis added.)  Aside from certain specific exceptions, all State contracts over $50,000 must be competitively 

bid.  The Department had both full knowledge of this statutory requirement and ample time to comply with it.  With 

a modicum of strategy and effort, moreover, the Department could have conducted a fair and open bidding process 

to select a winner in a lawfully transparent, yet still expeditious, manner.  Instead, the Department claimed 

disingenuously that the GSD contract constituted an “emergency” – without complying with the legal requirement 

to specify the nature of the supposed exigency.  Thus, a $2.5 million-dollar contract was awarded to GSD, a 

company handpicked rather than selected through the “time-honored” and legally required open, competitive 

process.  Doing so resulted in the apparent exercise of “favoritism,” barring any number of qualified applicants 

from being formally considered.    

 
1 Anderson v. Peterson, 221 Neb. 149, 153, 375 N.W.2d 901, 904 (1985) (internal citation omitted).   
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As explained in further detail below, the designation of the GSD contract as an “emergency” is unsupportable given 

both the circumstances and the amount of time that the Department had to search for a qualified service provider in 

compliance with statutory competitive bidding requirements.   
 

I wish to bring attention also to one proposed project touted as a major victory of the initiative to grow the State’s 

bioeconomy industry – a $5.5 billion sustainable aviation fuel (SAF) manufacturing facility planned for Phelps 

County, Nebraska, promoted by an East Coast company called DG Fuels.  After examining this business entity’s 

background, I have considerable doubts about the feasibility of the well-publicized venture – which appears not 

only to have made little, if any, significant progress since first being announced on August 7, 2024, but also exhibits 

disturbing similarities to numerous other evidently unfulfilled high-dollar projects promised by DG Fuels over the 

past decades.   
 

This letter points to a heightened need for not only suitable restraint in authorizing emergency (no-bid) State 

contracts but also due diligence when identifying a suitable developer – as evidenced by a proven track record of 

successful project planning and execution – to help shape Nebraska’s bioeconomy industry.  Otherwise, an ongoing 

risk remains of, at the very least, both violating current law and falsely raising expectations of Nebraska 

communities with illusory assurances of local development.    
 

Background Information 
 

Legislative Bill (LB) 1412 (2024), which was introduced at the request of the Governor on January 18, 2024, 

became law on April 2, 2024.  Section 106 of that legislation appropriated funds to the Department for “Program 

No. 603 - Industrial Recruitment,” stating the following: 
 

There is included in the appropriation to this program for FY2023-24 $2,500,000 General Funds to enter into a 

contract with an entity to assist the state, for a period of one year ending no later than June 30, 2025, with growing 

the state’s bioeconomy industry as defined by 88 Fed. Reg. 25711 (2023).  The entity shall recommend and support 

strategies that secure federal grants for Nebraska and increase the state’s real gross domestic product through 

bioeconomy development initiatives.  The Department of Economic Development shall electronically provide the 

results of the bioeconomy development initiative to the Legislative Council on or before June 30, 2025. 
 

(Emphasis added.)  Only one month after this legislative directive went into effect, the Department entered into a 

14-month, $2.5 million service contract (Contract) with GSD – a business about which, as explained later herein, 

little appears to have been known – on an emergency (no-bid) basis.   
 

The following brief timeline chronologizes significant events pertaining to the implementation of LB 1412 (2024) 

and the resulting multi-million-dollar bioeconomy Contract between GSD and the Department:  
 

• April 2, 2024 – LB 1412 (2024) went into effect. 

• April 29, 2024 – Former Department Director K.C. Belitz sent his former Deputy Director - 

Operations/Chief Legal Officer, Joseph Lauber, an email message that said, in part: “Here is the language 

for the bio-economy contract - already vetted thru Julie and the Governor, so I think it’s ready to be plugged 

in. Let me know if there are other questions we need to answer.” 

• April 30, 2024 – Former Deputy Director Lauber responded to former Director Belitz’s email message 

containing language from the pending Contract, asking: “Do we know the business name of the entity we 

will contract with and how the payment schedule should be laid out?  I think that is all we need to move 

forward.” 

• April 30, 2024 – Former Deputy Director Lauber emailed the President and CEO of GSD, Julie Bushell, a 

draft of the pending Contract and requested an image of a voided GSD check. 

• May 1, 2024 – Ms. Bushell signed the Contract.  Former Director Belitz signed the Contract the following 

day on May 2, 2024.    

• May 7, 2024 – Former Deputy Director Lauber signed an incomplete Procurement Exception/Deviation 

Form for an emergency contract.  Not only was the form dated prior to when it was signed on this day, but 

also its entire second page, which contained questions regarding the reasons for designating the contract as 

an emergency, was left blank – meaning that, contrary to express statutory mandate, no Department 
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justification of the emergency was provided.  See Attachment A hereto for an image of that incomplete 

form. 

• May 8, 2024 – Ms. Bushell opened a GSD bank account with no initial deposit.  She then ordered checks 

on the following May 29, causing the account balance to go negative.  The account balance continued to be 

negative through early July, when the first State payment was deposited.  

• May 29, 2024 – Ms. Bushell sent the Department a newly obtained cancelled check as well as the initial 

invoice and status report.  

• August 7, 2024 – DG Fuels issued a press release to announce the planned construction in Phelps County, 

Nebraska, of the company’s “first Midwest production facility” for synthetic aviation fuel (SAF).  

• August 9, 2024 – Ms. Bushell gave a presentation (Nebraska BioEconomy Accelerator - “Good for 

Business, Good for the Planet”) at the 2024 Nebraska Ag and Economic Development Summit in Kearney, 

Nebraska. 

• October 29, 2024 – A three-page amendment to the Contract was signed to expand the language in both § 

4.09 (“Conflict of Interest”) and § 4.17 (“State of Nebraska Non-Liability/Hold Harmless”) of the Contract, 

permitting GSD “to enter into separate agreements with third parties wherein the Contractor serves as a 

compensated service provider for the third party” and obligating the Department to hold GSD harmless 

from “any and all claims or demands” or “any loss or damage” resulting from such separate agreements, 

respectively.  Requested by Ms. Bushell, the amendment was prepared and signed by former Deputy 

Director Lauber.    

• December 17, 2024 – A town hall meeting was held at the Phelps County Ag Center in Holdrege, Nebraska.  

Hosted by members from the Phelps County Development Corporation, DG Fuels, Nebraska Public Power 

District, Southern Public Power District, and Ms. Bushell, the meeting provided a forum to explain the 

planned DG Fuels project for building a sustainable aviation fuel (SAF) plant in the county and answer 

questions from more than 300 attendees.  

• January 29, 2025 –  In response to a January 23, 2025, email inquiry by my office regarding, among other 

things, “why the statutory bidding requirements were not applicable” to the Contract, former Director Belitz 

stated the following: “The contract was submitted as an emergency contract to comply with the 

requirements of the bill and, specifically, to electronically provide the results of the bioeconomy 

development initiative to the Legislative Council on or before June 30, 2025.”    

• February 28, 2025 – The one-year Contract, with a monthly payment schedule spanning from the 

May 2, 2024, execution date through April 1, 2025, was amended to terminate approximately two months 

early on February 28, 2025. 

• March 5, 2025 – During a public hearing before the Legislature’s Appropriations Committee, former 

Director Belitz stated, “With the change in the Federal administration came an opportunity to amend the 

agreement with GSD to shorten the term.”  He added, “[W]e amended the contract to save the Nebraska 

taxpayers more than $400,000.” 

• July 8, 2025 – My staff and I met with former Director Belitz regarding the Contract and filings required 

under LB 1412 (2024).  During this meeting, the former Director stated that he was unsure whether the final 

“Nebraska Bioeconomy Report” had been filed with the Legislative Council, and he could recall little about 

the Department’s interactions with GSD prior to the Contract.    

• September 18, 2025 – My staff and I met with Ms. Bushell to discuss the Contract and the work performed 

by GSD.  During this meeting, Ms. Bushell explained the services provided by GSD pursuant to the 

Contract, including her role in securing Federal grants and loans for Nebraska businesses and governmental 

entities.  In addition to expressing enthusiastic support for DG Fuels, she disclosed that she had begun 

providing consulting services for that company after the Contract ended.  Ms. Bushell stated also that a 

major announcement about the DG Fuels project in Phelps County would be forthcoming. 

• December 17, 2025 – During a brief telephone conversation that I had with him, Governor Jim Pillen 

acknowledged that his office “recommended” to the Department that the Contract be awarded to GSD, 

saying that such encouragement resulted in a “joint decision” between him and former Director Belitz, then 

head of that code agency.     
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Neb. Rev. Stat. § 73-807(2) (Cum. Supp. 2024) of the State Procurement Act (Act) – which is set out at §§ 73-801 

to 73-819 (Cum. Supp. 2024, Supp. 2025) – requires State agency contracts in excess of $50,000 to “be bid by a 

competitive formal bidding process in the manner prescribed by the division procurement manual or a process 

approved by the Director of Administrative Services.”   

 

Neb. Rev. Stat. § 73-813 (Supp. 2025) allows “limited exceptions” to the Act’s competitive bidding requirements 

for, among other things, “emergency contracts.”  For purposes of the Act, Neb. Rev. Stat. § 73-803(6) (Supp. 2025) 

defines “emergency” as follows: 

 
Emergency means necessary to meet an urgent or unexpected requirement or when health and public safety or the 

conservation of public resources is at risk[.]  
 

(Emphasis added.)  Additionally, Neb. Rev. Stat. § 73-815 (Cum. Supp. 2024) requires, as is relevant, the following: 
 

In case of an emergency, contract approval by the state agency director or his or her designee is required.  A copy of 

the contract and state agency justification of the emergency shall be provided to the Director of Administrative 

Services within three business days after contract approval.  The state agency shall retain a copy of the justification 

with the contract in the state agency files. 

 

(Emphasis added.)  In light of the above provisions of the Act, the only remotely plausible basis for designating the 

Contract as an “emergency” would have been to conserve “public resources” – in the form, presumably, of 

unclaimed Federal grant monies placed “at risk” absent immediate action to obtain them.  Such a presumption is 

necessary because, as noted in the above timeline, the Department failed to comply with the requirement in § 73-

815 that “agency justification of the emergency” be “provided to the Director of Administrative Services within 

three business days after contract approval.”  The only other allowable reasons for an emergency designation, per 

the definitional language in § 73-803(6), would have been to respond to either “an urgent or unexpected 

requirement” or a “health and public safety” concern.  Clearly, neither of those alternatives were applicable to this 

situation.            

 

There is no reason to believe, based on either the definitional language in § 73-803(6) or anything else of which I 

am aware, that the routine and longstanding practice of applying for Federal funding constitutes “the conservation 

of public resources is at risk.”  Likewise, as addressed at greater length below, no time constraint in LB 1412 (2024) 

gave rise to an “an urgent or unexpected requirement.”  It has never been a secret or surprise that many Federal 

administrations, representing both sides of the aisle, have lavished state and local governments with funding for a 

wide array of purposes – a practice that seems to have gained momentum during recent years.  Many citizens are 

likely unaware, however, that well over one-third of all funds spent by State agencies is simply a reappropriation 

of Federal monies.   

 

This expansive governmental spending has persisted for quite some time, making the pursuit of available Federal 

dollars over the past year hardly “urgent or unexpected,” per § 73-803(6).  It would ring hollow to suggest, therefore, 

that an “emergency” somehow arose suddenly, justifying a multi-million-dollar, no-bid contract for soliciting 

Federal funds – when, in fact, there was ample time to conduct a fair and open bidding process and execute the 

resultant agreement without inviting the specter of illicit favoritism. 

 

As explained already, LB 1412 (2024) directed the Department to expend the appropriated $2,500,000 in General 

Funds “to enter into a contract with an entity to assist the state, for a period of one year ending no later than 

June 30, 2025, with growing the state’s bioeconomy industry[.]”  The Department had more than three months – 

from the April 2, 2024, effective date of LB 1412 (2024) to June 30, 2024, the latest that the mandatory one-year 

performance period could commence – to search for a qualified service provider in compliance with the competitive 

bidding requirements of the Act; however, barely a month passed between the effective date of the bill and the 

proffering of the Contract to GSD on April 30, 2024. 
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Worth recognizing also is that the Department is a code agency of State government subject to the Governor’s 

immediate control and whose Director serves at gubernatorial pleasure.  Such being the case, the Department’s 

administration was undoubtedly aware that an appropriations bill, containing a specific provision for funding a 

bioeconomy contract, was being drafted for introduction at the request of the Governor.  Had there been sincere 

interest in complying with statutory competitive bidding requirements, the Department had ample opportunity to 

do so by merely issuing a Request for Information (RFI) during the numerous months that the bill was being 

prepared and subsequently moving through the Unicameral.  Immediately upon enactment of that legislation, the 

Department could have published a Request for Proposals (RFP) with sufficient time to make an award through a 

fair and open competitive process.  Consequently, nothing either “urgent” or “unexpected” arose from LB 1412 

(2024) sufficient to support an emergency designation for the Contract.   

 

Furthermore, utilization of an RFI would not have been contingent upon passage of LB 1412 (2024) and resultant 

appropriation of the funds specified therein; however, it would have given interested parties notice of the potential 

bioeconomy contract – expediting the ensuing RFP process and allowing for timely completion of the 12-month 

bioeconomy development initiative specified in the bill.  

 

Rather than following the well-known competitive bidding provisions of the law, the Department declared an 

“emergency” and awarded a highly lucrative $2.5 million contract to a handpicked “winner” on a no-bid basis.  

There can be little doubt that adherence to statutory bidding requirements would have attracted numerous highly 

qualified applicants who, due to the lack of such action, were locked out of the opportunity to compete for the 

contract. 

 

As the Auditor of Public Accounts, duly elected by the people of Nebraska, I understand that I was not hired to look 

the other way when faced with allegations or evidence of suspect financial activity involving public funds. 

 

When selected for the Contract, very little information about GSD, including its identity, appears to have been 

available to the Department, which suggests that the agency entered into a $2.5 million contract with an entity about 

which it knew virtually nothing.  This is made evident by an April 30, 2024, email message, sent at 10:57 a.m., in 

which former Deputy Director Lauber asked, “Do we know the business name of the entity we will contract with 

and how the payment schedule should be laid out?”  The previous day, on April 29, 2024, former Director Belitz 

had sent him the Contract language, explaining that it was “already vetted thru Julie and the Governor, so I think 

it’s ready to be plugged in.”  After being provided with the payment terms and business name, the Department 

tendered the contract to GSD at 1:50 p.m. on April 30, 2024, slightly under three hours after former Deputy Director 

Lauber’s initial email inquiry. 

 

If the Department neglected to scrutinize the $2.5 million contract to GSD prior to approving it, former Director 

Belitz’s April 29, 2024, email message to former Deputy Director Lauber, as quoted above, indicates that the 

Governor’s office had assumed that “vetting” responsibility.    

 

Looking into its background, GSD filed a Certificate of Organization, as a domestic limited liability corporation, 

with the Nebraska Secretary of State on September 24, 2021.  On April 6, 2023, a Notice of Revocation letter was 

sent to GSD for failing to file its biennial report.  The biennial report was later filed by GSD on April 18, 2023, and 

the company is still active and in good standing as of early December 2025.  On July 8, 2025, moreover, I met with 

former Director Belitz, who proved unable to recall anything of significance about the history or qualifications of 

GSD, including how long it had operated before being selected for the Contract.  Former Director Belitz was 

similarly incapable of remembering if any other vendors had been considered to carry out the services authorized 

by LB 1412 (2024).  

 

Under the Contract, the Department paid GSD a flat fee of approximately $208,333 a month, with the express intent 

of spending the entire $2.5 million appropriated by LB 1412 (2024), to accomplish the goal of that legislation.   
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The following table is found under Part III (“Services & Payment Schedule”) of the Contract: 

 

 
 

As noted in the background timeline (pgs. 2-3) herein, the original 14-month-long term of the Contract – with an 

initial 12-month payment schedule spanning from the May 2, 2024, execution date through April 1, 2025 – was cut 

short by an amendment adopted on February 28, 2025, which ended the agreement as of that date.  Accordingly, 

the total payment to GSD was reduced from the original $2,500,000 to $2,083,333.34.  That three-page amendment 

provides the following revised pay schedule: 
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Per § 1.01 (“Services Performed by the Contractor”) of the Contract, GSD was to provide the following services: 
 

• Support Nebraska Bio-economy by making connections between Bioeconomy companies within Nebraska and 

connecting Nebraska Bioeconomy companies to Federal grant/loan opportunities. 

 

• Develop a 5 year “Roadmap to Nebraska Bio-Economy Success”, including strategies and tactics to grow capital 

investment and jobs, that is approved by the Governor by August 1, 2024. 

 

• Support Bioeconomy industry business and talent recruitment efforts. 

 

• Coordinate the submission of at least four (4) Federal Grant or Loan Applications per quarter from Bioeconomy 

companies operating in Nebraska or other Nebraska entities (e.g. utilities, public entities, or other infrastructure 

providers). 

 

• Coordinate at least two (2) Federal loans annually to Bioeconomy companies operating in Nebraska or other 

Nebraska entities (e.g. utilities, public entities, or other infrastructure providers). 

 

• Provide monthly reports, concurrent with invoices, that detail the progress towards the stated goals of LB 1412 

to assist the state with growing the state’s bioeconomy industry and to recommend and support strategies that 

secure federal grants for Nebraska and increase the state’s real gross domestic product through bioeconomy 

development initiatives.  
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GSD Role in Securing Federal Funding 

 

The State of Nebraska has long been the recipient of considerable Federal funding.  In fiscal year 2024 alone, State 

agencies spent $5.7 billion in Federal monies.  Obtaining these grants and other disbursements requires significant 

effort on the part of State personnel.  Under LB 1412 (2024), the service contractor selected was to “recommend 

and support strategies that secure federal grants for Nebraska.”  Per § 1.01 (“Services Performed by the Contractor”) 

the Contract, moreover, GSD was directed to do the following: 
 

Support Nebraska Bio-economy by making connections between Bioeconomy companies within Nebraska and 

connecting Nebraska Bioeconomy companies to Federal grant/loan opportunities.    

 

There appears to be little room to dispute that GSD fulfilled that contractual obligation.  My office analyzed the 

Federal bioeconomy grants and loans attributed to GSD’s assistance by the reports accompanying the monthly 

invoices that the company submitted to the Department.  It is difficult to evaluate, however, the significance of the 

role that GSD played in securing that Federal funding – especially since other states received comparable amounts 

of the same grant and loan monies, presumably without any involvement by GSD.  This leads to questions as to 

whether similar funding might have been obtained through the help of a different contractor or State personnel 

alone.  It is also true that, in some cases, promised Federal funds were never received.   

 

The U.S. Environmental Protection Agency (EPA) awarded a $307 million Climate Pollution Reduction 

Implementation Grant to the State of Nebraska – through the Nebraska Department of Water, Energy, and 

Environment (NDWEE) – on October 9, 2024.  According to the NDWEE’s own webpage, “The success of 

Nebraska’s application was made possible by the extensive public input from a broad range of partners and 

stakeholders across the state, including state and local government departments, public power districts, agricultural 

stakeholders, subject matter experts, and Nebraska citizens.”2  In a subsequent email message to my office, a 

NDWEE employee added, “GSD was involved [in the grant application and award process] through its coordination 

efforts with several federal agencies, both locally and in Washington, D.C., that were part of the grant award 

process.”  However, this Climate Pollution Reduction Implementation Grant was not awarded exclusively to 

Nebraska, as 24 other states obtained that same funding.  Those states included Illinois (awarded $430 million), 

Pennsylvania (awarded $396 million), a coalition of Connecticut, Maine, Massachusetts, New Hampshire, and 

Rhode Island (awarded $450 million), and a coalition of North Carolina, South Carolina, Maryland, and Virginia 

(awarded $421 million).    

 

Similarly illustrative are two renewable energy companies in Nebraska for which GSD has been credited as having 

helped to obtain Federal loans.  Bluestem Energy Solutions was awarded $3.6 million from the USDA’s Powering 

Affordable Clean Energy Program on June 26, 2024, and Sandhills Energy was awarded $29.4 million from the 

same program on August 8, 2024.  These two entities were among 50 others spread across 27 states and a U.S. 

territory, however, to receive a combined amount of over $1.4 billion in loans through the program.  In Nebraska, 

for instance, three other entities received program funding without GSD’s assistance: Loup Valleys Rural Public 

Power District ($7 million); Midwest Electric Coop Corp ($16.9 million); and the Village of Emerson ($1 million).  

Elsewhere, funding recipients included the Golden Valley Electric Association in Alaska ($100 million); TPI – 

Natural, LLC, in Arkansas ($47.7 million); Sierra Southwest Electric Cooperative in Arizona ($55.2 million); Delta-

Montrose Electric Association in Colorado ($72.2 million); West Grand Ridge Solar, LLC, in Florida ($81 million); 

and KPP Energy in Kansas ($35 million).   

 

GSD is credited also with having aided 55 individual Nebraska farmers and businesses receive a combined $10.3 

million in grants and loans from the USDA through the Rural Energy for America Program on January 10, 2025.  In 

fact, Nebraska was one of 42 states and 3 U.S. territories to obtain a combined 586 awards, totaling $179.9 million 

in loans and grants through the program.  Several other surrounding states also secured grant and loan awards, 

including: Iowa (51 awards totaling $7.9 million); Missouri (26 awards totaling $1.1 million); Kansas (60 awards 

totaling $8.2 million); Colorado (7 awards totaling $505,000); and South Dakota (17 awards totaling $2.7 million). 

 
2 https://dee.nebraska.gov/aid/one-red-opportunity-nebraska-reducing-emissions-decarbonization/one-red-implementation-

grant. 

https://dee.nebraska.gov/aid/one-red-opportunity-nebraska-reducing-emissions-decarbonization/one-red-implementation-grant
https://dee.nebraska.gov/aid/one-red-opportunity-nebraska-reducing-emissions-decarbonization/one-red-implementation-grant
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As mentioned already, some of the Nebraska grants attributed to GSD’s assistance have yet to materialize.  For 

example, Nebraska Electric G&T (NEG&T) was awarded a $200 million New ERA Program grant from the United 

States Department of Agriculture (USDA) on December 19, 2024.  Representatives from NEG&T informed my 

office that GSD had extensive involvement in the grant application and award process, including several in-person 

meetings with State and Federal officials.  NEG&T was one of 10 entities that received a combined $4.37 billion 

in loans and grants to electric cooperatives based in seven states, including: Connexus Energy in Minnesota ($170 

million); CORE Electric Cooperative in Colorado ($225 million); Georgia Transmission Corporation ($325 

million); Oglethorpe Power Corporation in Georgia ($331.5 million); San Miguel Electric Cooperative, Inc. in 

Texas ($1.4 billion); Seminole Electric Cooperative, Inc. in Florida ($1.3 billion); Trico Electric Cooperative Inc. 

in Arizona ($43 million); United Power in Colorado ($262 million); and Yampa Valley Electric Association in 

Colorado ($50 million).  Nevertheless, as of August 26, 2025, almost a year after the grant was awarded, NEG&T 

had not received any of those funds.  
 

Summary of DG Fuels and Michael Darcy, Chairman and CEO 
 

In the “Nebraska Bioeconomy Report” (Report) – which, per LB 1412 (2024), the Department was required to 

“electronically provide . . . to the Legislative Council on or before June 30, 2025” – GSD is noted as having arranged 

for DG Fuels, a self-proclaimed “emerging leader in renewable hydrogen and biogenic based, synthetic low 

emissions aviation and diesel fuel” based in Washington, D.C., to pledge construction of a sustainable aviation fuel 

(SAF) processing plant in Phelps County.  The prospect of this unprecedented $5.5 billion project in Nebraska was 

much publicized, raising the expectations of many with fanciful promises of an ensuing regional economic boom. 
 

To illustrate, an August 7, 2024, press release issued by DG Fuels claimed that the planned Phelps County project 

would “provide 650 quality careers, offset aquifer demand by transporting water required for production via rail, 

offer a local community coordinator, and include a comprehensive multi-million-dollar community benefits 

package that will directly enhance the County’s infrastructure, quality of life, and local strategic plan.”  According 

to a November 14, 2024, Phelps County Development Corporation press release included in the Report, moreover, 

the DG Fuels plant would “majorily [sic] impact the local economy, boosting retail and agricultural sales and 

creating hundreds of jobs.”  The project would accomplish, the press release continued, the following for Phelps 

County: 
 

Once the plant is operational, the projected annual payroll for 640 permanent DG Fuels employees will reach $54 

million and create an additional 313 secondary jobs such as doctors, teachers, restaurant workers, etc.  That 

secondary employment is expected to generate more than $16 million annually. . . .  [T]he community could expect to 

see a 15.7 percent increase ($6.3 million) in retail sales annually once the project is complete. 
 

* * * * 
 

DG Fuels will purchase an estimated 1.2 million tons of corn stover annually adding $144 million into the pockets of 

farmers in the South Central Nebraska region with no negative impacts on supplies for cattle feed or nutrient 

replenishment in the fields.       
 

The proposed project is headed by Michael Darcy, the Chairman and CEO of DG Fuels – a company that has gone 

through various names, including the D’Arcinoff Group.  Mr. Darcy’s entrepreneurial history for almost a quarter 

of a century has included the promotion of numerous extravagant business ventures.  Most recently, he has proposed 

multibillion-dollar sustainable energy projects in Nebraska and other locations.  Aside from being built upon 

breathtaking visions resembling that predicted for Phelps County, those big-budget undertakings, whether domestic 

or overseas, appear to share one important commonality: They rarely, if ever, come to fruition.     
 

Recently, I spoke with former Congressman Collin Peterson of Minnesota regarding DG Fuels’ declared plan in 

2024 to construct a sustainable aviation fuel (SAF) processing plant in the northwest of that state – a project quite 

similar to the one proposed by the company for Phelps County, Nebraska.  As well as working for years as a 

Certified Public Accountant, former Congressman Peterson was elected to a staggering 15 terms in the U.S. House 

of Representatives, serving the district where the hypothetical DG Fuels plant would supposedly be sited.  
 

During much of his time in Congress, Peterson chaired the House Committee on Agriculture and is no stranger to, 

among other things, various agricultural special interests pitching uneconomic and unrealistic projects in the hope 

of receiving Federal funds and loan guarantees.  
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Being familiar specifically with DG Fuels and its proposals, former Congressman Peterson offered the following 

unabashed evaluation of that company’s promise to build an SAF processing plant: 
 

“In my opinion, there is no way in hell that thing is ever going to be built.  DG 

Fuels put out their press release without any meaningful input from the local 

community to be impacted.  I am concerned for those who might make decisions 

or assumptions based on press releases.”  
 

Despite an apparently uninterrupted history of nonperformance and unfulfilled assurances by Mr. Darcy, his 

company’s recent promise to build a $5.5 billion SAF manufacturing facility in Phelps County – a proposal that, 

lacking any tangible framework or even definite funding source, resembles numerous unrealized forerunners – was 

trumpeted by GSD as a notable achievement in “growing the state’s bioeconomy industry,” per LB 1412 (2024).   
 

Interestingly, between 2008 and 2023, Mr. Darcy appears to have been the defendant in various warrant in debt and 

garnishment actions in Virginia.  Brought by plaintiffs such as credit card companies and a homeowners association, 

these civil suits sought to recover debts ranging from less than $2,000 to little over $13,000.  Mr. Darcy is listed 

also as a defendant in a Federal tax lien case involving $6,746.  Being taken to court for such relatively insignificant 

amounts seems rather incongruous for someone claiming responsibility for multi-billion-dollar bioenergy projects 

now being pitched in various states, including Nebraska.                  
 

The table below details numerous unaccomplished projects promoted by Mr. Darcy.  There may be others, but these 

were the most readily accessible.  Despite my best efforts, moreover, I was unable to find any successful sustainable 

energy projects of note undertaken by Mr. Darcy or DG Fuels. 
 

Location Year Projected Cost 

Project 

Implemented 

Fully? Description 

Maryland 2002 $1,640,000,000.00  No 

This project planned to use the Sparrow’s Point shipyard in 

Baltimore, Maryland, to build three cruise ships.  The project 

reportedly needed $1.64 billion in government-backed loans; 

however, the loans do not appear to have been acquired, and 

the project remains presumably incomplete. 

New York 2009 $10,000,000,000.00  No 

This project was aimed at converting auto part manufacturing 

plants, including the New Process Gear (a.k.a., New Venture 

Gear) plant in Syracuse, New York, into factories to produce 

wind turbine parts.  The project needed over $10 billion in 

Federal tax credits.  However, the tax credits do not appear to 

have been granted, and the project remains presumably 

incomplete. 

Indiana 2009 Unknown No 

This project planned to establish a manufacturing facility in 

Henry County, Indiana, to produce wind turbine and heliostat 

parts. The plan was estimated to create up to 20,000 jobs and 

utilize closed automotive plants.  One facility was expected to 

start operations in 2012.  However, the project appears never 

to have become operational. 

Texas 2013 $4,600,000,000.00  No 

This project (a.k.a., The West Texas Renewable and Gas 

Monetization Project) planned to develop a synthetic biofuel 

processing plant on an over-190,000-acre swath of land in 

Hudspeth County, Texas.  The initial cost was projected at 

approximately $4.6 billion.  GE Aviation signed a 10-year 

agreement with D’Arcinoff Group in 2013 to purchase 

synthetic biofuel from the plant starting in 2016.  However, no 

further progress on the project appears to have been made. 

Indiana 2014 Unknown No 

This project planned to construct a synthetic biofuel facility 

capable of producing 30,000 barrels of fuel per day on 3,000 

acres in an undisclosed location in central or southern Indiana.  

No further information could be found about the project. 



 

Page 11 of 27 

Location Year Projected Cost 

Project 

Implemented 

Fully? Description 

Tennessee 2014 Unknown No 

This project planned to construct a synthetic biofuel facility 

capable of producing 30,000 barrels of fuel per day on 3,000 

acres in an undisclosed location in eastern Tennessee.  No 

further information could be found about the project. 

California 2014 Unknown No 

This project planned to construct a synthetic biofuel facility 

capable of producing 60,000 barrels of fuel per day on 25,000 

acres in an undisclosed location in southern California.  No 

further information could be found about the project. 

Maine 2022 $4,130,000,000.00  No 

This project involves the construction of a $4.13 billion 

sustainable aviation fuel (SAF) manufacturing facility at the 

former Loring Air Force Base near Limestone, Maine.  The 

ground is expected to be broken at the site in 2026, and 

construction is slated to take approximately five years.  The 

project is to be funded through the U.S. Department of Energy 

and commercial equity. 

Louisiana 2024 $4,000,000,000.00  No 

This project involves the construction of a $4 billion SAF fuel 

manufacturing facility in St. James Parish, Louisiana.  

Production of fuel is expected to begin in 2028, and a final 

investment decision should be made in 2026. 

Nebraska 2024 $5,500,000,000.00  No 

This project involves the construction of a $5.5 billion SAF 

manufacturing facility in Phelps County, Nebraska.  In April 

2025, the total investment costs were reported to have 

increased to $7 billion.  The final investment decision is 

expected to be made in 2025 or 2026.  Neither lands nor any 

Federal grants or loans appear to have been acquired as of 

August 2025. 

Minnesota 2024 $5,000,000,000.00  No 

This project involves the construction of a $5 billion 

sustainable aviation fuel manufacturing facility in Moorhead, 

Minnesota.  Fuel production is expected to begin prior to 2030.  

The Minnesota Legislature authorized a tax credit of $1.50 for 

every gallon of fuel produced and sold in that state as a 

development incentive. 

 
Not one of the above 11 projects pitched by Mr. Darcy or DG Fuels appears to have materialized.   

 

Included in Attachments B through D hereto are copies of press releases and news articles pertaining to some of 

these proposed DG Fuels projects. 

 

Finally, it is worth noting that, upon conclusion of the Contract with the Department, GSD began working in an 

advisory capacity for DG Fuels.  Though permitted by an amendment to the Contract, such an arrangement could 

give rise to concerns regarding possible lack of independence by, or even undue influence upon, GSD while 

promoting the DG Fuels project – one of the supposed triumphs for which Nebraska paid GSD $203,333.33 a month 

under the Contract.    

 

It should be noted that my office contacted Mr. Darcy by email on December 2, 2025, in an effort to arrange a 

conference call to discuss the information herein – as well as possibly other matters – relating to not only him and 

DG Fuels but also the status of his company’s proposed project in Phelps County.  Mr. Darcy replied to that initial 

communication by requesting an agenda for the anticipated telephone meeting and suggesting that it take place 

sometime after December 15, 2025.  After providing him immediately with the information sought and proposing 

a date that conformed to his stated schedule, my office received no further response from Mr. Darcy – despite 

repeated attempts on our part at further correspondence.  Consequently, my office’s best efforts to arrange it 

notwithstanding, the desired conference call with Mr. Darcy failed to transpire.  
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Legislative Considerations 
 

Only a small fraction of one percent of the more than 8,400 State contracts executed over the past two fiscal years 

(2023-2024 and 2024-2025) have been designated as emergencies.  Moreover, the agreement with GSD was the 

Department’s only emergency (no-bid) contract during that period.   
 

Though exceedingly rare, any use of the emergency exemption under the Act is significant and deserving of 

scrutiny.  This is because an improper emergency designation would both negate the underlying purposes of the 

Act – which, per Neb. Rev. Stat. § 73-802 (Cum. Supp. 2024), are “to establish a standardized, open, and fair 

process for selection of contracts and to create an accurate reporting of expended funds for such contracts” – and 

place at risk valuable tax dollars.  The Department’s emergency designation and the resulting award of the $2.5 

million Contract to an entity about which that awarding agency was admittedly ignorant is emblematic of this 

concern.  I encourage the Legislature to consider, therefore, ways of curtailing such questionable designations in 

the future.   
 

One possibility might be requiring all emergency contracts to be filed with the Auditor of Public Accounts (APA).  

Neb. Rev. Stat. § 73-815 (Cum. Supp. 2024) of the Act currently states, in relevant part, the following: 
 

In case of an emergency, contract approval by the state agency director or his or her designee is required.  A copy of 

the contract and state agency justification of the emergency shall be provided to the Director of Administrative 

Services within three business days after contract approval.  
 

A simple legislative solution could take the following form: 
 

In case of an emergency, contract approval by the state agency director or his or her designee is required.  A copy of 

the contract and state agency justification of the emergency shall be provided to both the Director of Administrative 

Services and the Auditor of Public Accounts within three business days after contract approval. 
 

Notifying the APA, along with the Director of Administrative Services, of emergency contracts would provide, if 

nothing else, a second level of oversight aimed at helping to prevent abuse, intentional or otherwise, of the 

emergency exemption to the Act’s competitive bidding requirements.  The APA has no enforcement authority and, 

like the Director of Administrative Services now, would not be empowered to reject any emergency contract 

submitted.  Nevertheless, realization that the APA would be reviewing and, as necessary, reporting upon such 

contracts could help encourage agencies to adhere more scrupulously to the provisions of the Act – including the 

required submission of the agency’s “justification of the emergency,” which, as mentioned previously herein, was 

glaringly omitted from the GSD contract’s emergency designation approval by the Department’s former Director.   
 

Regardless of whether through a statutory amendment similar to that shown above or some other measure, directing 

the APA to be notified promptly of any new emergency contracts would help to safeguard public funds by enabling 

my staff, as well as those of future Nebraska State Auditors, to be more immediately effective at what they do best 

– namely, reviewing documents pertaining to the expenditure of public funds and sounding an alarm when 

potentially problematic activity, such as that detailed herein, is identified.     
 

* * * * * * 

 

It is my wholehearted desire that this letter will both prove informative and honor the words chiseled into the 

wall above the north entrance to our State Capitol building: “The Salvation of the State is watchfulness in the 

citizen.”     
 

Sincerely, 
 

 

 

 

Mike Foley 

Nebraska Auditor of Public Accounts 

Room 2303, State Capitol 

Lincoln, NE 68509 

Phone (402) 471-2111 

Mike.Foley@nebraska.gov 
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