
The enclosed documents are attorney/client privileged and exempt under KRS 

61.878(1)(l), which incorporates the attorney/client privilege and work product 

doctrine found at CR 26.02(3).  Louisville has chosen to waive the attorney/client 

privilege and work product exemption for those parts of the timeline and bills that 

are not redacted.  Louisville is claiming privilege for all portions of the timeline and 

bills that are redacted.  Additionally, the redacted portions of the timelines and bills 

are also being claimed as exempt under KRS 61.878(1)(l) which incorporates the 

protection provided to juveniles under KRS 610.320 and KRS 610.340; under KRS 

61.878(1)(a) to protect personal information that might identify a victim or an 

investigator; and pursuant to court order that sealed the lawsuits related to this 

investigation. 



The enclosed documents refer to individuals, acts, and events that are the subject of 

pending criminal and civil litigation.   To the extent that the enclosed documents 

identify “perpetrators” and “victims” and describe behavior which, if proven, may 

constitute a crime, those portions of the enclosed documents should be read as 

conveying allegations, still unproven.  All such statements are mere accusations and 

any accused is presumed innocent until and unless proven guilty.  By law, all persons 

referenced herein as having committed a criminal act are presumed innocent unless 

proven guilty, and the conclusions reached herein do not mean that an individual has 

been convicted of the crime(s) for which he or she is accused.  Any statement 

pertaining to criminal wrongdoing should be understood as an allegation that has yet 

to be decided in a Court of law. 



Perpetrator Victim Date When 
Discovered 

Who Discovered Chief Conrad 
Notified 

Mayor Fischer 
Notified 

 
. 

9,Oct.
2002 

Oct. 10, 2002 Flaherty;  Major Tim 
Emington,  
Jefferson County Police 
Department  

Fall 2016 March 2017 

Betts 2007 22,Nov.
2016 

PIU After November 22, 
2016 

After November 22, 
2016 

Betts 2007 Nov. 9, 2016 PIU After November 9, 
2016 

After November 9, 
2016 

Betts  2010 2013 PSU September 17, 2013 November 2016 

Betts  2012 Oct. 3, 2016 PIU October 2016 November 2016 

Wood  2011 Oct. 5, 2016 PIU October 2016 November 2016 

Betts 2012 Dec. 8, 2016 PIU After December 8, 
2016 

March 2017 

Betts July 
2012 

Oct. 5, 2016 PIU October 2016 November 2016 

Betts  July 
2012 

Oct. 17, 2016 PIU October 2016 November 2016 

Betts July 20, 
2013 

July 20, 2013 PIU July 22, 2013 November 2016 

Wood 2016 19,Sept.
2016 

PSU After September 19, 
2016 

November 2016 

MINOR

Explorer#10

Explorer #9

Explorer#2

Explorer #7

Explorer #5

Explorer#11

Explorer #5

Explorer #8

Explorer #1

Explorer #3



July 6, 2016 D.B. files Terroristic Threatening 3rd complaint 

July 28, 2016 D.B. files formal complaint against Officer Brandon Wood with PSU 

September 19, 2016 D.B. informs PSU that Officer Wood engaged in criminal conduct.  

PSU investigation suspended. 

September 20, 2016 PIU case opened and assigned to Sgt. Scott Gootee of the Public 

Integrity Unit 

September 27, 2016 Investigators interview complainant D.B. 

September 29, 2016 Investigators interview 

October 3, 2016 Investigators interview 

October 3, 2016 Investigators interview B.S. 

October 4, 2016 Investigators interview 

October 4, 2016 Investigators interview J.M. 

October 5, 2016 Investigators interview . 

October 6, 2016 Search warrant executed on home of Brandon Wood 

October 6, 2016 Brandon Wood suspended from LMPD 

October 7, 2016 Investigators send preservation request to SnapChat 

October 7, 2016 Search warrant executed on home of J.S. and B.P. 

October 7, 2016 Investigators inspect Officer Wood’s police vehicle 

October 11, 2016 Investigators interview J.A. 

October 11, 2016 Investigators interview . 

October 13, 2016 Search warrant executed on home of Kenneth Betts 

October 17, 2016 Investigators interview . 

October 19, 2016 Investigators interview T.W. and S.W. 

October 19, 2016 Search warrant executed on .’s phone 

October 24, 2016 Investigators interview J.S. 

October 24, 2016 Investigators interview  again 

October 24, 2016 Investigators interview R.P. 

October 28, 2016 Investigators receive PSU case 13-137 – Betts matter 

November 1, 2016 Investigators interview J.S. 

November 1, 2016 Investigators interview C.S. 

November 1, 2016 Investigators interview . 

November 1, 2016 Investigators interview M.F. 

November 3, 2016 Investigators interview . 

November 9, 2016 Investigators interview . 

November 15, 2016 Investigators interview J.C. 

November 22, 2016 Investigators interview . 

December 8, 2016 Investigators interview . 

December 14, 2016 Investigators interview M.F. 

January 5, 2017 Investigators interview . 

January 9, 2017 Investigators interview A.M. 

January 9, 2017 Investigators interview H.M 

January 9, 2017 Investigators interview M.P. 

January 25, 2017 Investigators interview J.W. 

#3

#7

#4

#5

#5

#8

#5

#5

#2

#8

#9

#10

#11

#6



February 2, 2017 Investigators meet with Commonwealth Attorney’s office 

February 8, 2017 Investigators meet with investigator from Ky. Ag’s office regarding 

child pornography unrelated to the LMPD Explorer investigation. 

March 8, 2017 First forensic exams returned by KY Attorney General 

March 9, 2017 Investigators interview D.T.  

March 13, 2017 Investigators receive report from Attorney General’s office 

April 12, 2017 Wood indicted 

April 13, 2017 Wood fired from LMPD 

LEXINGTON 74462-1 67436v1 



Fall 1991 Curtis Flaherty begins work as an Explorer Advisor 

September 1999 Kenneth Betts joins LPD Explorer program 

June 2000 Brandon Wood joins LPD Explorer program 

October 14, 2002 Allegations of sexual misconduct against Explorer  by two 

females.  Lt. Flaherty submits written report to Major Tim Emmington 

addressing the allegations. 

January 2003 Louisville/Jefferson County merger 

February 13, 2016 Betts starts with LMPD as a recruit 

November 2007 Wood starts with LMPD as a recruit 

2007 Betts takes Explorer . to Iroquois Park and demands oral sex. . 

19 at the time.  . denies performing sex.  . did not notify anyone. 

2007 Betts forcibly performs oral sex on Explorer ., who was 17 at the 

time.  . did not notify anyone. 

2010 Betts has inappropriate relations with .  This includes offering 

money for sex and touching ’s genitals. . tells this to Brandon 

Wood, who asked Lt. Flaherty to contact .  Wood did not mention 

sexual misconduct.  Flaherty believed the issue involved sunglasses.  

Flaherty tried to call ., but . would not return calls. 

2011 Betts is seen in Iroquois park at night with an unknown male in his 

police cruiser.  No reports made. 

Wood has sex with ., who was 17 at the time.  did not notify 

anyone. 

Wood exchanges sexually explicit emails with  Explorer 

 who was 16 at the time.  Wood met  at Explorer camp.  

later dated Wood when he as a student at Bellarmine College and over 

18. did not notify anyone of his contacts with Wood.

2012 - Betts exchanges nude pictures with , who was 17 at the time. 

- Betts has sex with , who was 17 at the time. 

- Betts has sex with ., who was over 18. 

- Betts touches .’s genitals at the Fort Collins, Colorado explorer 

conference. 

None of the individuals notified authorities. 

2013  incident.  Officer Paris notifies authorities, including Lt. Flaherty.  

A PSU investigation is initiated. Betts removed from Explorer programs 

and ultimately fired. 

2016 Wood exchanges sexually explicit emails with Explorer  who was 

17 at the time.  Wood also offers to give police lights to J.S. in exchange 

for nude photographs of   No reports made. 

#10 #10
#10 #10

#9

#9

#2

#2 #2
#2

#2 #2

#5 #5

#6 #6 #6

#6

#11

#8

#5
#7

#1

#3

#3



D.B. in a relationship with Wood.  After they breakup, D.B. alleges 

Wood sent a video depicting Wood and D.B. having sex to     D.B. 

notifies authorities on September 19, 2016. 

LEXINGTON 74462-1 64653v1 
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July 20, 2013 Betts sends text to Explorer . 

July 20, 2013 PIU sent to interview . 

July 22, 2013 Chief Conrad informed of misconduct 

July 29, 2013 Chief Conrad orders formal PSU 
investigation 

July 30, 2013 PSU case assigned to Sgt. Chuck Mann 

July 30, 2013 Sgt. Mann interviews . and parents 

August 2, 2013 Second interview with ’s parents 

August 2, 2013 Sgt. Mann interviews Julie Schmidt 

August 5, 2013 48 hour notice sent to Brad Schuhmann 

August 5, 2013 Sgt. Mann interviews  via phone 

August 6, 2013 Sgt. Mann interviews Brad Schuhmann 

August 8, 2013 Sgt. Mann interviews Schuhmann’s girlfriend 

August 8, 2013 Sgt. Mann interviews Schuhmann’s mother 

August 9, 2013 Sgt. Mann interviews Brandon Paris 

August 12, 2013 Sgt. Mann calls .’s neighbor 

August 16, 2013 Sgt. Mann interviews  in person 

August 19, 2013 48 hour notice sent to Curtis Flaherty 

August 19, 2013 Sgt. Mann interviews Curtis Flaherty 

August 26, 2013 Sgt. Mann interviews ’s neighbor via 
phone 

August 29, 2013 Sgt. Mann interviews Kenneth Betts 

August 30, 2013 Sgt. Mann completes investigation 

Sept. 5, 2013 Sgt. Mann submits findings to Lt. Meagher 

Sept. 13, 2013 Lt. Meagher submits findings to Major 
Burbrink 

Sept. 17, 2013 Major Burbrink submits findings to Chief 
Conrad 

#1

#1

#1

#1

#2

#1

#2

#1



March 24, 2014 Betts resigns 

April 4, 2014 Chief Conrad closes case by exception 



IN ACCOUNT WITH 

. ~ 

DI.CKINSONrvRJGHTPLLC 

CITY OF LOUISVILLE 
527 WEST JEFFERSON 
4TH FLOOR 
LOUISVILLE, KY 40202 

CLIENT/MADER NO. : 074462-00001 

RE: LMPD MATIER 

300 W EST V I NE STREET , S U ITE 1700 

LEXINGTON, K Y 40507 - 1621 

TEI.EPUONE: (859) 899-8700 

h tt p: //www .d ic k insonw ri gh t. com 

FEDERAL I.D. #38-1364333 

INVOICE DATE: SEPTEMBER 11, 2017 
INVOICE NO. : 1193255 

PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2017 USD 

TOTAL FEES CURRENT INVOICE .......... . ... . . . .. .. . ......... . .. . . . . . . . .. . . . . . $ 14,077.50 

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS CURRENT INVOICE . . . .. .... . .. . .. . . . . . . .... . .. . . .. ... . . $ 4,056.00 

TOTAL CURRENT INVOICE ..... . .. . . .. .. . . ... .. . . .. . .. .. . .. . .. . .... . . . . .. .. ... . $ 18,1 33.50 

OUTSTANDING INVOICES ON THE MATIER BILLED ON THIS CURRENT INVOICE AS OF SEPTEMBER 11.2017 

INVOICE 

1174013 
1184802 

DATE 

06/20/17 
08/04/17 

BILLED VALUE 

14,424.65 
1,402.50 

PAYMENTS 

(13,929.65) 
(0.00) 

OUTSTANDING 

495.00 { 
1.402.50 t ,~ &, q /w 11 

TOTAL OUTSTANDING FROM PRIOR INVOICES . . . ...... . ........... . .. . . . .. . . . .. . . $ 1,897.50 

TOTAL AMOU NT DUE .. . .. . ...... . . . . . . . . . . ..... . .......... .. . .. ...... . . . .. . . . . $ 20,031.00 
===~=== 

..•. -~~ Remittance Instructions .. .~ ''· 
***Terms : Due and Payable Upon Receipt*** 

Mail To: ACH Instructions: Wire Instructions: 
Dickinson Wright PLLC JP Morgan Chase Bank N.A. JP Morgan Chase Bank N.A. 
2600 W. Big Beaver 28660 Northwestern Highway 28660 Northwestern Highway 
Suite 300 Southfield, Ml 48034 Southfield, Ml 48034 
Troy, Ml 48084 ABA Number: 072 000 326 ABA Number: 021 000 021 

Account# 38852 Swift Code: CHASUS33 (International) 
Account# 38852 

(Please Reference Invoice Numbers) (Please Reference Invoice Numbers) 



IN A CCOUNT WIT I I 

~ D JCKI N SONr'RI G HTPLLC 

3 00 W EST VINE STREET, SU ITE 170 0 

L EXI NG TON , K Y 4050 7- 1621 

TELEPHONE: ( 859) 899-8 7 00 

hllp ://www. dick i nsonwrigh l. com 

FEDERAL J.D. #38-1 364333 

LMPD MATIER INVOICE DATE: SEPTEMBER 11,2017 
CLIENT/MATTER N0.:074462-00001 INVOICE NO. : 1193255 

PAGE 2 

CURRENT INVOICE DETAIL 

DATE INITIALS SERVICES HOURS VALUE 

08/03/17 KBH Telephone conference with LEAs; Conference with Mr. 0.8 220.00 
Sparks 

08/03/17 AS Call with commonwealth attorney and LMPD investigators 0.8 220.00 

08/07/17 KBH Review notes from conference call ; Exchange messages 0.8 220.00 
with Mr. Mason; Telephone conference with  

08/08/17 KBH Telephone conference with Louisville-Metro Council 0.3 82.50 
member; Review PIU investigative file 

08/09/17 KBH Telephone conference with Mr. Mason; Conference with 0.2 55.00 
Mr. Sparks 

08/09/17 AS Call with Clay Mason re: investigative update and next 0.2 55.00 
steps 

08/10/17 KBH Exchange messages with counsel; Review personnel 0.8 220.00 
records 

08/11/17 KBH Review witness list; Leave messages for potential 1.2 330.00 
witnesses; Conference with Mr. Mason 

08/11/17 AS Meet with investigator/review of material 0.8 220.00 

08/14/17 KBH Exchange messages regarding interview schedule; Review 1.1 302.50 
open records production 

08/15/17 KBH Prepare for interviews 0.5 137.50 

08/16/17 KBH Telephone conference with Ms. Elliott; Attention to interview 0.6 165.00 
issues 

08/17/17 KBH Telephone conference with Mr. Bailey; Review media 3.4 935.00 
reports regarding FOP suit; Prepare for interviews; 
Telephone conferences regarding FOP suit 

08/17/17 AS Prepare for interview with Police Chief 1.0 275.00 

08/18/17 KBH Telephone conferences with Mr. Mosely and Mr. Mason; 0.8 220.00 
Attention to FOP issues 

08/18/17 AS Review of interview summaries/material 1.0 275.00 

08/21/17 AS Review of court documents for Officers Betts and Wood 0.5 137.50 

08/22/17 AS Review LMPD case file material 6.3 1,732.50 

08/23/17 AS Review investigative material 1.3 357.50 

08/24/17 KBH Telephone conference with Mr. Mosely; Attention to FOP 0.5 137.50 
grievance 

08/25/17 KBH Telephone conference with ; Prepare 0.6 165.00 
messages regarding interviews; Attention to potential 
interview targets 

08/25/17 AS Review LMPD investigative material 3.6 990.00 

FBI AGENT

FBI AGENT



IN A CCOUNT W ITH 

~ 
DICKINSONrvRIGHTPLLC 

LMPD MATTER 
CLIENT/MATTER N0.:074462-00001 

DATE INITIALS SERVICES 

300 Wr,sT VIN E STREET, SUIT ~ 1700 

L EX I NGTON, K Y 40507-16 21 

TEI.F.I'HONF. : ( 859) 899-8700 

h t tp :1/www . dick ins on wr ight .com 

FEDERAL I.D. #38- 1364333 

INVOICE DATE: SEPTEMBER 11 , 2017 
INVOICE NO.: 1193255 
PAGE3 

HOURS VALUE 

08/28/17 KBH Telephone conference with Mr. Kuhn; Review interview 2.4 660.00 
notes 

08/28/17 AS Listen to interviews conducted by LMPD 5.6 1,540.00 

08/29/17 KBH Attention to messages from Mr. Mason 0.3 82.50 

08/29/17 AS Review of interviews conducted by LMPD 3.0 825.00 

08/30/17 KBH Attention to messages; Review interview summaries; 2.1 577.50 
Conference with Mr. Sparks and Mr. Mason 

08/30/17 AS Meet with investigator re : interviews 1.0 275.00 

08/30/17 AS Review LMPD interview tapes 4.4 1,210.00 

08/30/17 AWC Review Court dockets regarding indictments re Kenny Betts 0.5 107.50 
and Brandon Wood; Office conference with A. Sparks 

08/31/17 AS Review of LMPD interviews 4.9 1,347.50 

TOTAL FEES 51.3 $ 14,077.50 

DATE DISBURSEMENTS tffp11J1 VALUE 

07/29/17 OTHER PROFESSIONALS INVESTIGATIVE SERVICES 4,056.00 ole.,. 
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 

Sc:rco t:'l 
$ 4,056.00 

TOTAL CURRENT INVOICE $~ 18.1 33.5§;> 

TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY I 

TIMEKEEPER TITLE RATE HOURS VALUE 

KERRY B. HARVEY MEMBER 275.00 16.4 4,510.00 

ANDREW L. SPARKS OF COUNSEL 275.00 34.4 9,460.00 

ANGELA W. COATES PARALEGAL 215.00 0.5 107.50 

TOTAL FEES CURRENT INVOICE 51 .3 $ 14,077.50 



• < 

IN ACCOUNT WITH 30l ;ST VINE STR EET , SUI TE 1700 

.r.-:: 
0ICKINSONr'RIGHTrLLC 

LEXINGTON, KY 40507 -1621 

TELEPHONE: (859) 899-8700 

hi I p :I lwww.d ick in so nw r ight. com 

FEDERAL !.D. #38-1364333 

2018 ~I 
I 

INVOICE DATE: APRIL 23, 2018 
INVOICE NO.: 1251824 

CITY OF LOUISVILLE 
527 WEST JEFFERSON 
4TH FLOOR 
LOUISVILLE, KY 40202 

CLIENT/MATTER NO.: 074462-00001 

RE: LMPD MATTER 

PRf\I!LEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH MARCH 31, 2018 

TOTAL FEES CURRENT INVOICE.. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $ 

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS CURRENT INVOICE .. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $ 

TOTAL CURRENT INVOICE.. ... ......................... .. . . .. ........... . ..... $ 

OUTSTANDING INVOICES ON THE MATTER BILLED ON THIS CURRENT INVOICE AS OF APRIL 23.2018 

INVOICE 

11 74013 
1216911 

DATE 

06/20/17 
12/11/17 

BILLED VALUE 

14,424.65 
38,370.05 

PAYMENTS 

(13,929.65) 
(14,286.96) 

OUTSTANDING 

495.00 
24,083.09 

USD 

47,080.00 

85.14 

47,165.14 

TOTAL OUTSTANDING FROM PRIOR INVOICES . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $ 24,578.09 

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE ......... . ..... . .. . .. . .... . ......... . . ....... .... ... . .... . $ 71,743.23 ---------

Remittance Instructions 
***Terms: Due and Payable Upon Receipt*** 

Mail To: ACH Instructions: Wire Instructions: 
Dickinson Wright PLLC JP Morgan Chase Bank N.A. JP Morgan Chase Bank N.A. 
2600 W. Big Beaver 28660 Northwestern Highway 28660 Northwestern Highway 
Suite 300 Southfield, Ml 48034 Southfield, Ml 48034 
Troy, Ml 48084 ABA Number: 072 000 326 ABA Number: 021 000 021 

Account# 38852 Swift Code: CHASUS33 (International) 
Account# 38852 

(Please Reference Invoice Numbers) (Please Reference Invoice Numbers) 



' IN ACCOUNT WITH JOe "ST V I NE STREET, S UI T E 1700 

~ D I CKI N so Nf!VRlG HTPLLC 

LEX I NGTON, K Y 40507 -1 621 

TE L EPHONE: (859) 899 - 8700 

ht tp ://www . dick ins on w r ight .com 

FEDERAL J.D. #38-1364333 

LMPD MATTER INVOICE DATE: APRIL 23, 2018 
CLIENT/MATTER N0.:074462-00001 INVOICE NO.: 1251824 

PAGE2 

CURRENT INVOICE DETAIL 

DATE INITIALS SERVICES HOURS VALUE 

12/26/17 KBH Exchange messages with Chief Conrad; Review interviews 0.5 137.50 

01/05/18 AS Update of mayor's office re: status/interview with Chief 4.0 1,100.00 
Conrad 

01/05/18 KBH Prepare for Interview; Conference with Ms. Hesen and Mr. 6.8 1,870.00 
Mosely; Interview Chief Conrad; Travel to and from 
Louisville 

01 /12/1 8 KBH Prepare correspondence to Mr. Yates; Prepare 1.1 302.50 
correspondence to Metro Council; Telephone conference 
with Chief Conrad; Conference with Mr. Sparks 

01/14/18 KBH Prepare correspondence to Metro Council; Prepare 0.6 165.00 
message to Ms. Hesen and Mr. Mosely 

01 /15/18 KBH Telephone conference with client; Review witness 1.6 440.00 
statements 

01/16/18 KBH Attention to depositions 0.3 82.50 
01/17/18 KBH Telephone conference with Mr. James 0.2 55.00 
01 /19/18 KBH Research Jaw regarding Criminal Rule 6(e) 0.4 110.00 
01/19/18 KBH Exchange messages with Chief Conrad 0.2 55.00 
01/23/18 KBH Review depositions; Telephone conference 1.8 495.00 
01/23/18 AS Review timeline/investigative material in preparation to 1.0 275.00 

update city council 

01 /24/18 KBH Review deposition testimony; Telephone conference; 5.7 1,567.50 
Prepare message to Metro-Council; Meeting with Metro 
Council leadership 

01/24/18 AS Meet with city council 1.5 412.50 
01/29/18 KBH Telephone conference with Metro council member; 1.3 357.50 

Te!ephons ccnfere~ce \v!th L~.1PD; Rsv!evv CJ i~fes; 
Telephone conference with Mr. Kuhn 

01/29/18 AS Research USAO WDKY's claim of 6(e) privilege 0.5 137.50 
01/30/18 KBH Review discovery materials 0.3 82.50 
02/06/18 KBH Telephone conference with client; Review Open Records 0.8 220.00 

Act 

02/08/18 KBH Review policies and procedures 0.7 192.50 

02/09/18 KBH Exchange messages with Mr. Kuhn and USAO staff 0.4 110.00 

02/10/18 KBH Review LMPD policies and procedures 2.1 577.50 

02/12/18 KBH Review witness statements; Conference with Mr. Sparks 0.5 137.50 

02/12/18 AS Review of material for writing report 5.0 1,375.00 

02/13/18 AS Review material for final report 1.0 275.00 
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LMPD MATTER INVOICE DATE: APRIL 23, 2018 
CLIENT/MATTER N0.:074462-00001 INVOICE NO.: 1251824 
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DATE INITIALS SERVICES HOURS VALUE 

02/14/18 AS Review material for report 0.5 137.50 

02/15/18 KBH Prepare correspondence to Mr. Thomas 0.5 137.50 

02/15/18 AS Review of materials/work on report 2.0 550.00 

02/16/18 AS Review material/work on report 4.0 1,100.00 

02/19/18 KBH Review Ethics Code 0.6 165.00 

02/20/18 KBH Attention to correspondence from Mr. Thomas 0.2 55.00 

02/21 /18 KBH Conference with Mr. Sparks ; Review GJ Rules; Review 1.2 330.00 
Complaint 

02/21 /18 AS Review new complainVcase material 2.0 550.00 

02/22/18 KBH Review Complaint; Review CRT USAM provisions 0.8 220.00 

02/22/18 AS Review Chief Conrad's deposition 0.5 137.50 

02/23/18 KBH Conference with USA and FBI 5.1 1,402.50 

02/23/18 AS Meeting with USAO/FBI re: claim of 6(e) material 6 .0 1,650.00 

02/25/18 KBH Conference with Mr. Sparks; Revise correspondence to Mr. 1.2 330.00 
Coleman 

02/26/18 KBH Conference with Mr. Sparks; Research law regarding 2.1 577.50 
Grand Jury proceedings; Telephone conference with 
councilman 

02/26/18 AS Draft letter to USAO EDKY outlining the internal 3.0 825.00 
investigation, addressing their 6(e) concerns, and making 
specific requests for documents of the LMPD 

02/26/18 AS Work on timelines/report 2.0 550.00 

02/27/18 KBH Review Interview Notes 0.5 137.50 

02/28/18 KBH Telephone conference with client 0.3 82.50 

03/05/18 KBH Conference with Mr. Sparks 0.4 110.00 

03/05/18 AS Review interview summaries/work on report 3.0 825.00 

03/09/18 KBH Interview Chief Conrad ; Prepare for Interviews; Interview 2.6 715.00 
Mayor and Deputy Mayor; Review witness summaries 

03/09/18 AS Conduct interview 1.0 275.00 

03/12/18 KBH Prepare file memoranda 1.2 330.00 

03/12/18 AS Review material/write report 6.0 1,650.00 

03/13/18 KBH Review PIU information; Review Interviews 1.1 302.50 

03/13/18 AS Review material/work on report 7.0 1,925.00 

03/14/18 AS Review material and work on report 7.0 1,925.00 

03/15/18 KBH Attention to policies and procedures; Attention to witness 1.2 330.00 
interviews 

03/15/18 AS Review material/work on report 3.0 825.00 



IJ'! ~CCOUNT W ITH 

.r.:­
D ICKINSONf"RIGHTPLLC 

LMPD MATIER 
CLIENT/MATIER N0.:074462-00001 

DATE INITIALS SERVICES 

03/16/18 AS Review materials/work on report/confirm timelines 

03/17/18 AS Review correspondence from DOJ; work on report 

03/1 9/18 KBH Attention to correspondence from Mr. Coleman; 
Conference with Mr. Sparks 

03/19/18 AS Correspond with DOJ and review material for report 

03/20/18 KBH Telephone conference with Councilman James; 

30, ~ST ViNE STRE ET , S UI TE 1700 

LEX I N GT ON, K Y 4 050 7-16 2 1 

TELE PH ONE: (859) 89 9-8700 

h tt p:// ww w . d ic k insonw r i g h t . com 

FEDERAL !.D. #38-1364333 

INVOICE DATE: APRIL 23, 2018 
INVOICE NO. : 1251824 
PAGE4 

HOURS VALUE 

7.0 1,925.00 

2.0 550.00 

1.2 330.00 

4.0 1,100.00 

5.2 1,430.00 
Conference ·.vith Mr. Sparks; Review interviews; interview 
Chief Conrad; Interview Mr. Jones 

03/20/18 AS Conduct witness interviews 2.0 550.00 

03/20/18 AS Review material/work on report 3.0 825.00 

03/21/18 KBH Prepare File memoranda 1.1 302.50 

03/22/18 KBH Prepare Interview summaries; Interview Deputy Chief 3.6 990.00 
Sullivan; Prepare Report 

03/22/18 AS Prepare for/conduct interview 1.5 412.50 

03/23/18 KBH Prepare witness interview summaries; Telephone 2.3 632.50 
conferences with counsel ; Review messages 

03/24/18 KBH Review Interview summaries 0.4 110.00 

03/26/18 KBH Telephone conference with media and Mr. Mosley; 
Interview Ms. Hesen 

2.5 687.50 

03/26/18 AS Conduct interview 0.8 220.00 

03/27/1 8 KBH Prepare file memoranda; Review witness statements 0.8 220.00 

03/27/18 AS Work on final report 3.0 825.00 

03/28/18 KBH Review LMPD policies 0.4 110.00 

03/28/18 AS Work on final draft of report 3.5 962.50 

03/29/18 AS Work on final report 8.5 2,337.50 

03/30/18 AS Work on report 10.0 2,750.00 

03/30/18 KBH Prepare Report 0.6 165.00 

03/31/18 KBH Prepare Report 3.5 962.50 

TOTAL FEES 171.2 $ 47,080.00 

DATE DISBURSEMENTS VALUE 

09/27/17 Reversal from Cancelled Voucher 889352 (4,230.99) 
09/27/17 LEGAL SERVICES OF OTHERS-- VENDOR: CLAY MASON AND ASSOCIATES 4,230.99 



. 
• I 

· (I-! A CCOUNT WITH 

~ 
DICKINSON"'fVRIGHTrLLC 

LMPD MATTER 
CLIENT/MATTER N0.:074462-00001 

DATE DISBURSEMENTS 

02/23/18 TRAVEL EXPENSES MILEAGE- KERRY B. HARVEY 

TIMEKEEPER 

KERRY B. HARVEY 
ANDREW L. SPARKS 

TOTAL FEES CURRENT INVOICE 

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 

TOTAL CURRENT INVOICE 

TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY 

TITLE 

MEMBER 
OF COUNSEL 

JOe eST ViNE STR EET , SUITE 170 0 

LE XI NGTON, K Y 40507-162 1 

TE LEPHON E: (859) 899-8700 

ht tp:// www . dick in so nwri g ht. com 

FEDERAL I.D. #38-1 364333 

INVOICE DATE: APRIL 23, 2018 
INVOICE NO. : 1251824 
PAGE 5 

RATE 

275.00 
275.00 

HOURS 

65.9 

105.3 

VALUE 

85.14 

$ 85.14 

$ __ 4;.;.7,1.;, 1.;;,65;;,;,·,;,.14;,.... 

VALUE 

18,122.50 
28,957.50 

171 .2 $ 47,080.00 



~ 
DICKINSON~RIGHT~LLC 

APR272017 .,, 
~-/I 

····-· -·· ·----· 
CITY OF LOUISVILLE 
527 WEST JEFFERSON 
4TH FLOOR 
LOUISVILLE, KY 40202 

CLIENT/MATTER NO.: 074462-00001 

RE: LMPD MATTER 

1 00 W ES'I V JN J; S 'I Rt.J: f' . S t ' IH 1700 

I' Hi T ON, K Y 40507- i (l~! 

'1 U HIIONE: (859) 899-8700 

h ttp ::/ww w .dickinson wright .com 

FEDERAL I.D. 1138- 1364333 

INVOICE DATE: APRIL 19, 2017 
INVOICE NO.: 1158179 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH MARCH 31,2017 USD 

TOTAL FEES CURRENT INVOICE . .. ....... . ................ ........ .. .. . .. ...... $ 7,480.00 

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS CURRENT INVOICE . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $ 26.89 -------'--
TOTAL CURRENT INVOICE. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . • . . . . . $ ___ ...;.7.:.;;,5..;.0,;;.;6 . .;;.89~ 

Remittance Instructions 
***Terms: Due and Payable Upon Receipt*** 

Mail To : ACH Instructions: Wire Instructions : 
Dickinson Wright PLLC JP Morgan Chase Bank N.A. JP Morgan Chase Bank N.A. 
2600 W. Big Beaver 28660 Northwestern Highway 28660 Northwestern Highway 
Suite 300 Southfield, Ml 48034 Southfield, Ml 48034 
Troy, Ml 48084 ABA Number: 072 000 326 ABA Number: 021 000 021 

Account# 38852 Swift Code: CHASUS33 (International) 
Account# 38852 

(Please Reference Invoice Numbers) (Please Reference Invoice Numbers) 



IN ACCOUNT WITH 1 "~ Wf.ST VJN~ S J' REET, SUIT E 1700 

~ 
DrcKrNsoNrvRrGHTruc 

l NG T ON, K Y 40507-1 6 2 I 

TELHIIONE: (859) 899-8700 

h ll p :// www. dickinso n wri gh l.co m 

FEDERAL I. D. #38-1364333 

LMPD MATTER 
CLIENT/MATTER N0.:074462-00001 

INVOICE DATE: APRIL 19,2017 
INVOICE NO.: 1158179 
PAGE2 

CURRENT INVOICE DETAIL 

DATE INITIALS SERVICES 

03/17/1 7 KBH Travel to Louisville; conference with Mayor Fischer and 
staff; Interview with CJ; Telephone conference with Ms. 
Hess 

03/18/17 KBH Review media reports regarding LMPD Explorers program 

03/20/17 KBH Telephone conference with Ms. Hesen; prepare request for 
dcc;;nl;:r.ts; To~Gph.Jnc C·Jnfcrcr.cr.: \Vith .3tnt~ and federa! 
law enforcement authorities; Review media reports 

03/21/17 KBH Prepare Mason Agreement; Conference call with LMPD 
representatives 

03/21/17 LJM Research and analysis of Kentucky statutes mandating 
duty to report child abuse. 

03/22/17 KBH Telephone conferences with law enforcement officers; 
Telephone conferences with Ms. Hesen 

03/23/17 KBH Telephone Conferences with Potential Witnesses; Review 
Civil Complaint: Prepare file memorandum 

03/27/17 KBH Telephone conference with Mr. Thomas; Conference with 
Mr. Mason; Prepare file memorandum; Review LMPD notes 

03/27/17 LJM Research and analysis of Kentucky statutes mandating 
duty to report child abuse; research and analysis of 
Kentucky case law applying and interpreting statutes 

03/30/17 LJM Continue research and analysis of Kentucky statutes 
mandating duty to report child abuse; continue research 
and analysis of Kentucky case law applying and interpreting 
statutes; begin drafting memorandum re LMPD's duty to 
report child abuse to Cabinet. 

03/31 /17 KBH Review LMPD documents 

TOTAL FEES 

DATE DISBURSEMENTS 

03/29/17 TRAVEL EXPENSES MILEAGE- WILLIAM P. SOWERS 

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 

TOTAL CURRENT INVOICE 

HOURS 

9.8 

1.3 

2.7 

3.2 

0.2 

1.3 

2.1 

2.1 

1.2 

2.0 

1.3 
-----·- -·--

27.2 $ 

VALUE 

2,695.00 

357.50 

742.50 

880.00 

55.00 

357.50 

577.50 

577.50 

330.00 

550.00 

357.50 
-------- ·-

7,480.00 

VALUE 

26.89 

$ 26.89 

$ __ 7 .... 5 .... 06,;,..8,;,.9,_ 



. . 
' IN A (COUNi" WITII 

;:: 
D I CKIN SON f/"RI G HTrLLC 

LMPD MATTER 
CLIENT/MATTER N0.:074462-00001 

TIMEKEEPER 

KERRY B. HARVEY 

LOGAN J. MAYFIELD 

TOTAL FEES CURRENT INVOICE 

TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY 

TITLE 

MEMBER 

ASSOCIATE 

0 ~ '1 WEST V I NE SrK EET, SUITE 1 700 

1NGTON, K Y 40507-1621 

T l:.I . EPIIONf;: (859) 899 -8700 
http :1/ww w .dick i nson wri gh t. c e> m 

FEDER/\ I, J.D. #38-1 364333 

INVOICE DATE: APRIL 19,2017 
INVOICE NO.: 1158179 
PAGE 3 

RATE 

275.00 

275.00 

HOURS VALUE 

23.8 6 ,545.00 

3.4 935.00 

27.2 $ __ 7_, . ..,.48-0.;.;.0~0=1 



1 00 WES T VINE STREH. S UITE 17 00 

~ 
DICKJ NSO N(\VRIGHTruc 

:XI'IG T ON , KY 40507-162 1 

I'ELH fi ONE : (859) 899-8700 

hI tp ://www .di ck inson w r ight. co m 

FEDERAL f.D. N38-1364333 

CITY OF LOUISVILLE 
527 WEST JEFFERSON 
4TH FLOOR 
LOUISVILLE, KY 40202 

CLIENT/MATTER NO.: 074462-00001 

R.E : LMPD MATTER 

INVOICE DATE: MAY 18, 2017 
INVOICE NO.: 1166744 

tJ JL r: ~)71 I 11 

~ t~~>JI ~~~ 
$4ts ~ Lf[?.,lf}t1 ~ 

PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL be-~ \~ 
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH APRIL 30,2017 ~ b; II . 

TOTAL FEES CURRENT INVOICE . ...... ... · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · -~-- · .... /C ~ /. ~ $ 10,477.50 

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS CURRENT INVOICE.. ..... ... . ... ... ... . ~I fW~$ ____ _ 8_3._00_ 

TOTAL CURRENT INVOICE . ........................... .. .... . . . . ~ .. .. . .. . ·u $ 10,560.50 

OUTSTANDING INVOICES QN TH_E MATTER BILLED ON THIS CURRENT INVOICE AS OF MAY 18. 2017 

INVOICE 

1158179 

DATE 

04/191'17 

BILLEQ.YALUE 

7,506.89 

PAYMENTS OUTSTANDING 

(0.00) 7,506.89 

TOTAL OUTSTANDING FROM PRIOR INVOICES ................... . .. . . .... . ... .... $ 7,506.89 

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE ........ . ............... . . . ... . .. . ..... . . . . . . ...... .. ... . . $ 18,067.39 ___ ....:......., __ 

·~:.~. :'f. > Remittance Instructions . " .. ,,.-ll'i..:''·"t,·• .U[)."'\ ;)1'~- . _;J_I 

*"•Terms: Due and Payable Upon Receipt *** 
Mail To: ACH Instructions : Wire Instructions: 

Dickinson Wright PLLC JP Morgan Chase Bank N.A. JP Morgan Chase Bank N.A. 
2600 W. Big Beaver 28660 Northwestern Highway 28660 Northwestern Highway 
Suite 300 Southfield, Ml 48034 Southfield, Ml 48034 
Troy, Ml 48084 ABA Number: 072 000 326 ABA Number: 021 000 021 

Account# 38852 Swift Code: CHASUS33 (International) 
Account# 38852 

(Please Reference Invoice Numbers) (Please Reference Invoice Numbers) 



IN .'\ C'COUNTWITil 0 00 WES T V I NE STREET, SUIH 1700 

.r.-:-D I CKIN soN f!'!R1 G HTPLLC 

XINGTON, KY 40507-1621 

T ELEPHON E: (859) 899-8700 

http: // www. dickinson wr ig h I.e om 

FEDERAL J.D. #38- 1364333 

LMPD MATTER INVOICE DATE: MAY 18, 2017 
CLIENT/MATTER N0.:074462-00001 INVOICE NO. : 1166744 

PAGE2 

CURRENT INVOICE DETAIL 

DATE INITIALS SERVICES HOURS VALUE 

04/01/1 7 KBH Review LMPD materials 1.3 357.50 
04/03/17 KBH Telephone Conferences with Ms. Hesen and Mr. Bailey 0.8 220.00 
04/04/17 KBH Review LMPD materials 2.1 577.50 
04/05/17 LM Continue drafting memorandum regarding LMPD's duty to 

r.::port chiid abuse to Callinei. 
1.6 440.00 

04/06/17 KBH Review LMPD Investigative Files 2.1 577.50 
04/07/17 KBH Review LMPD Investigative Files 0.6 165.00 
04/07/17 LM Continue drafting memorandum regarding LMPD's duty to 

report child abuse to Cabinet. 
1.1 302.50 

04/09/17 LM Continue drafting memorandum regarding LMPD's duty to 
report child abuse to Cabinet. 

1.0 275.00 

04/10/17 KBH Review LMPD Investigative Files 1.6 440.00 
04/10/17 LM Research and analysis of Kentucky Multidisciplinary 1.6 440.00 

Commission on Child Sexual Abuse Model Protocol, child 
abuse reporting statutes, and legislative history of child 
abuse reporting statutes. 

04/10/1 7 LM Finish drafting memorandum regarding LMPD's duty to 
report child abuse to Cabinet. 

1.0 275.00 

04/10/17 LM Revise and edit memorandum regarding LMPD's duty to 
report child abuse to Cabinet. 

1.1 302.50 

04/11 /1 7 KBH Conference call with Ms. Watson, et al; Review 0.6 165.00 
Investigative materials 

04/1 2/17 KBH Conference with Ms. Watson, et al regarding contract 
modifications; Meet with Metro Counsel Contracts 

6.2 1,705.00 

Committee; Review reports regarding Belts/Wood 
indictment 

04/1 3/17 KBH Attention to contract modifications; Review LMPD 0.5 137.50 
Investigative materials 

04/14/1 7 KBH Review LMPD files; Telephone conference with Ms. Lundin 1.1 302.50 
04/17/1 7 KBH Telephone Conference with Mr. Wine; Conference with Mr. 

Mason; Telephone Conference with Ms. Foster 
1.4 385.00 

04/24/1 7 KBH p Interviews 1.1 302.50 
LM Draft and revise first amended complaint and proposed 1.8 

order. 

~wo ~ 



I~ Ac.COU!'/1' \VITH 

. r.;-
DICKINSONfi"RIGHTrLLC 

LMPDMAITER 
CLIENT/MATTER N0.:074462-00001 

DATE INITIALS SERVICES 

04/28/17 KBH Prepare for Interviews; Conduct five Interviews 

'IJO W EST VINE STREET, SUITE 1700 

XINGTON, K Y 40507- 1621 

'I ELEPIIONE: (85 9) 899-8700 

http :1/www .dick i nsonwri gh t .com 

FEDERAL J.D. #38·1364333 

INVOICE DATE: MAY 18, 2017 
INVOICE NO.: 1166744 
PAGE 3 

04/29/17 KBH Prepare file memoranda regarding witness interviews 

HOURS 

8.8 

0.7 

VALUE 

2,420.00 

192.50 

TOTAL FEES 

DATE DlS3i.JRSEMENTS 

04/12/17 TRAVEL EXPENSES MILEAGE- KERRY B. HARVEY 

TIMEKEEPER 

KERRY B. HARVEY 

LOGAN J. MAYFIELD 

TOTAL FEES CURRENT INVOICE 

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 

TOTA L CURRENT INVOICE 

TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY 

TITLE 

MEMBER 
ASSOCIATE 

RATE 

275.00 

275.00 

38.1 $ 10,477.50 

83.00 

$ 83.00 

$ __ 1;.;;.0,:,;;;,5.;.60;;.;..5.;..;0~ 

HOURS VALU E 

28.9 7,947.50 

9.2 2,530.00 

38.1 $ _...;.1 0.;.:.•.;.;4 7..;.7.;.;;. 5~0=-l 



Dickinson Wright PLLC 

Sta ndard Terms of Engagement 

We are pleased that you have retained Dickinson Wright PLLC to provide legal services. Below arc the standard terms of engagement in 

relation to any matter on whi ch you retain us, unless otherwise set forth in your engagement letter and subject always to applicable rules of 

professional conduct. Please review this document carefully and retain it with your files. If you have any questions about how our legal services will 

be provided, how you will be billed. the scope of our representation or any other matter related to our representation of you, please contact a member 

of the Firm promptly. 

1. Tlte Scope of Our Serl'ices. Our engagement letter to you sets forth the specific matter for which representation will be provided and the 

scope of our services. The services we will provide to you may be varied by agreement during the course of the matter. Our services will not include 

advice on tax-related issues unless and to the extent specifically requested by you and included in the scope of our representation. 

At times we may be called upon to express opinions of law or anticipated outcomes. Such opinions are limited by our knowledge of the facts at 

the time the opinion is rendered, the present state of the law and, at times, factors that arc unknown or beyond our control. Although we wi ll use our 

best profes~ional .iud!!ment , we .:an not guarantee the outcome of any matter. 

2. Primary Attorney. The primary attorney(s) responsible for your client relationship with the Firm may, in the exercise of his/her/ their 

professional judgment, involve other attorneys (including other members or associates), paralegals or non-legal professionals possessing special 

knowledge or experience to improveefticiency. 

Our invoices for services may reflect time and professional services rendered by attomeys or other legal personnel associated with the Firm's 

internntional or other atliliate(s). Such attorneys, who are licensed in other jurisdictions, are consulted and serve as legal advisors to the Firm based 

on their licensed status in such jurisdictions and expe11ise in particular legal specialties. 

3. The Client. Dickinson Wright PLLC wi ll provide representation for only the person(s) or entity identified in our engagement letter. In 

matters related to corporations, partnerships and other entities, unless otherwise agreed in writing, our representation does not extend to ollicers, 

directors, employees. shareholders, partners, members or other individuals. Additionally, unless otherwise agreed in writing, our representation of an 

entity does not extend to its afli liates (such as parent, sister or subsidiary corporations). 

4. Basis of Our Ch11rges. Unles~ other a1Tangements are made. our billing for legal services will be on a per hour basis. Our standard hourly 

rates will apply in the absence of any other agreement, and detai ls of the hourly rates for the attorneys working on your matter(s) are available upon 

request. Our hourly rates are subject to periodic reviews and adjustments and we reserve the right to revise our hourly rates in accordance with such 

general Firm reviews. 

The Rules of Professional Conduct generally permit a law fi rm to consider the following factors in addition to regular hourly rates: the novelty 

and ditliculty of the question involved: the skill requisite to perform the legal services; the likelihood that acceptance of a particular matter will 

preclude other representation; the tee customarily charged in the locality for similar services; the risk assumed by the finn in pet-forming certain types 

of work, and the amount involved and results obtained. Time limitations imposed by the client or by other circumstances may also be considered in 

determining an appropriate fee. We reserve the right to consider all of these factors and submit a billing or billings in excess of the homly rates 

quoted above. 

We are ofien asked to provide estimates regarding the cost of our representation on a given matter. We are pleased to provide such estimates 

when, in our professional judgment, they can be made. Unless we agree in writing to perform a specific project tor a fixed fee, an estimate will not 

represent a maximum, minimum or agreed charge. 

5. Reimbursement of Costs ami £>:penses. In addition to our hourly fees, we may incur costs and disbursements on your behalf for which 

you will be obligated to reimburse us. It is our Finn policy to submit invoices for costs and disbursements charged by third parties in excess of$1,500 

to you for direct payment. Costs and disbursements of third parties incurred by the Firm on your behalf are billed without any administrative add-on. 

Costs incurred internally on your behalf are generally charged at predetermined standard rates: $0.20 per copy, $2.00 per fi rst page, $1.00 per 

subsequent pages for faxes and $12.00 per month for each gigabyte of data stored in our litigation support document database. Computerized legal 

research (CALR) charges are billed at our legal research providers' standard retail rates. Please note, however, that the Firm pays tor CALR on an 

annual Firm-wide lixed fee basis. Long distance phone charges are billed at tari ITiates. 

6. Freque11cy of Billing. We will bill you monthly for time and disbursements. Remittance within 30 days is expected. We reserve the right 

to impose a charge of I% per month on accounts which are not paid within such 30-day period. If you have any questions on any invoice, please mise 

them with the member primarily responsible for the matter as soon as possible. If any portion or e lement of an invoice is questior]ed, the remainder of 

the invoice is to be paid within 30 days. 



7. Retainers. Unless otherwise set forth in the engagement letter. it is understood that Dickinson Wright PLLC may withdraw amounts from 

the retainer at any time as may be necessal)' to satisfy outstanding invoices. If at any time the retainer proves insufficient to cover past due invoices 

or falls below tile agreed amount, you will be called upon to replenish the retainer amount. Any unused portion of the retainer remaining after all 

legal services have been paid for will be refl.mded. 

8. Conflicts of Interest. Confl icts of interest are a concern for Dickinson Wright PLLC and the clients we represent. We attempt to identify 

actual and potential conflicts at the outset of any engagement and may request that you sign a conflict waiver before we accept an engagement from 

you. Occasionally, other clients or prospective clients may ask us to seek a conflict waiver from you so that we can accept an engagement on their 

behalf: Please do not take Stich a request to mean that we will represent you less zealously; rather, that we take our professional responsibilities to all 

c lients and prospective clients very serious ly. 

Unfortunately, contlicts sometimes arise or become apparent after work begins on an engagement. When that happens, we will do our best to 

address and resolve the situation in the manner that is consistent with our professional responsibili ties. 

We will not represent any other client on any matter on which we are representing you unless we have your express agreement that we may do 

so and where pennitted to do so by the appl icable jurisdiction's Rules of Professional Conduct. 

We may also a<.:t general!)' 101 another ciicm which, tor you, IS a marketcompeti\Or. 

9. Linhility In~umnce Coverage. It is your responsibility to asce11ain whether you are covered by any relevant insurance in respect of either 

liability or legal expenses. If so, you are responsible to notify your insurer(s) of the claim or potential claim ar.d our involvement as soon as possible. 

It is also your responsibility to infonn us if you believe that you have insurance coverage for the specific matter for which we have been retained. 

10. Termination of Representation. You may terminate our representation at any time, with or without reason. We have a right to 

discontinue providing services under cenain c ircumstances, such as your failure to fullill your financial obligations to us. Your termination of our 

representation in no way relieves you of the obligation to pay for legal services that have been provided prior to the time of termination and that are 

necessitated to make an orderly transfer of our tile materials. 

Upon term ination of our representation for any reason, we will return your papers, documents and other property to you upon receipt of your 

request lor them. We may, and likely will, retain a copy of the materials returned to you. If you have outstanding invoices owing to the Firm, we 

may have the right to retain your documents if they are properly subject to a lien. 

At such time as we have completed the scope of work for which we have been retained, we will consider our representation to have ended. If 

you Iuter retain us to perform further or additional work, our future representation will be subject to the terms of and understanding set forth herein, 

unless other terms and conditions are expressly agreed to. 

I I. Recordi Retention. Subject to paragraph I 0 above, any materials belonging to you will be returned to you at the conclusion of the 

engagement. Following the engagement, in accordance with Firm policies, applicable law and the applicable jurisdiction's Rules of Professional 

Conduct regarding ownership of fi les and fi le retention, we will retain our files relating to this matter for a period of years, after which time the 

fil es may be destroyed. We will make reasonable etTorts to notify you prior to the destruction of any physical or electronic files . A reasonable 

charge may be imposed for any spec ial requests pertaining to disposition or handling of our files. 

12. E-Mail und Cellul11r Plume Autlwrizntion. Dick ins•.,n Wright PLLC is abl~ to communicate with clients via electronic mail over th<! 

internet ("e-mail") and many of our utlorneys milizc (.cllular phonfs. With e-mail, current technology cannot eliminate the risk ~hat confidences 

and/or secrets otherwise protected by attorney/client pl'ivil ege may be viewed by unauthorized third parties and the privilege thereby lost. As to both 

means of communication. sensitive, confidential and proprietary materials of the client may be intercepted by unauthorized third parties. Please be 

advised that in connection with the use of e-mail and cellular phones. (a) there is the risk of the loss of the attorney/client privilege and that sensitive, 

confidential or proprietary material may be inadvertently disclosed to unauthorized third parties; (b) the Firm standard tor ~-mai l encryption is 

Transpon Layer Security (TLS) protocol; and (c) you have the right to specifically direct Dickinson Wri ght PLLC not to send the client sensitive, 

confidential or proprietary materials via e-mail or to utilize a cellular phone when communicating. 

Unless you specifically provide direction to the contrary, your acceptance of our engagement letter will indicate your review of this policy 

statement on the use of e-mai l and cellular phones and will speci lically authorize Dickinson Wright PLLC to util ize e-mail, to send information over 

the inte rnet to communicate with you and with third parties, and to util ize cellular phones. By engaging our Finn, you agree to assume the risk of 

inadve11ent disclosure and the risk of the loss of attomey/client privilege as it relates to infonnation being transmitted. You retain the ri ght to direct 

Dickinson Wright PLLC not to send specific items of information via the internet. by e-mail or over a cellular phone. This authorization shall remain 

in e!Tcct until revoked in writing. 

f'l ease feel free to contact the attorney at the Finn responsible tor the matters you have engaged us to address on your behalf if you have any 

questions regarding this policy. 



l ri/\CCOUNT WITII 

CITY OF LOUISVILLE 
527 WEST JEFFERSON 
4TH FLOOR 
LOUISVILLE, KY 40202 

CLIENT/MATTER NO.: 074462-00001 

WES T V IN E S T REET, SU ITE 170 0 

LF.X INGT ON, KY 40507- 16 21 

TF.LEPIION io: (859) 899-8700 

http: //www. dick i nSOil\\/ r igh t. com 

FEDERAL I.D. #38-1364333 

INVOICE DATE: JUNE 20, 2017 
INVOICE NO.: 1174013 

RE: LMPD MATTER 

PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH MAY 31,2017 USD 

TOTAL FEES CURRENT INVOICE ................................... . ......... ... $ 14,217.50 

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS CURRENT INVOICE. . . . ........... . ....... .. . . . . .. . ... . . $ ___ ___;;;2...:c.07_._15'--

TOTAL CURRENT INVOICE ..... . ........................... . ..... . ......... . ... $ 14,424.65 

OUTSTANDING INVOICES ON THE MATTER BILLED ON THIS CURRENT INVOICE AS OF JUNE 20 201 

INVOICE 

1158179 
1166744 

DATE 

04/19/17 
05/18/17 

BILLED VALUE 

7,506.89 
10,065.50 

PAYMENTS 

(0.00) 
(0.00) 

OUTSTANDING 

7,506.89 
10,065.50 

TOTAL OUTSTANDING FROM PRIOR INVOICES ... ... . ... . .. . . . .... .. .... . . . ....... $ 17,572.39 

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE ......... . .... . .... . . .. . . . . . . .... . .. . . . . .. .. ....... . .... . . $ 31,997.04 
~--..;_--

po±l 
'-(ftJ I/ O/ .J 0 ---~?,000 tJ ,. 0 52-/3- I 

Remittance Instructions 
***Terms: Due and Payable Upon Receipt*** 

Mail To: A CH Instructions: Wire Instructions: 
Dickinson Wright PLLC JP Morgan Chase Bank N.A. JP Morgan Chase Bank N.A. 
2600 W. Big Beaver 28660 Northwestern Highway 28660 Northwestern Highway 
Suite 300 Southfield, Ml 48034 Southfield, Ml 48034 
Troy, Ml 48084 ABA Number: 072 000 326 ABA Number: 021 000 021 

Account# 38852 Swift Code: CHASUS33 (International) 
Account# 38852 

(Please Reference Invoice Numbers) 1Piease Reference Invoice Numbers) 



IN ACCOUNT WITII 

~ D I·CKI N SON(WRI G HTI'LLC 

. , WEST VtNF. STREET , SL'ITE 1700 

LF.X I NGTON, KY 4 0507-1621 

TELEI'IIONE: (859 ) 899-8700 

http ://www_ d ic k i nsonwrigh 1. com 

FEDERAL 1.0. #38- 1 364333 

LMPD MATTER INVOICE DATE: JUNE 20, 2017 
CLIENT/MATTER N0.:074462-00001 INVOICE NO.: 1174013 

PAGE 2 

CURRENT INVOICE DETAIL 

DATE INITIALS SERVICES HOURS VALUE 

05/01/1 7 KBH Conference with Mr. Sparks; Prepare interview memoranda 1.3 357.50 

05/01/17 AS Review of complaint fi led by N.C. ; review of documents 1.5 412.50 
describing the factual background/allegations of misconduct 

05/02/17 KBH Prepare Interview memoranda; Telephone conference 1.4 385.00 
rcga;dir.IJ U.1PD intarvi~ws; T dlephone cunlerence wiiil Ms. 
Watkins 

05/03/17 KBH Prepare Interview memoranda: Telephone conference with 1.2 330.00 
Mr. Sitlinger 

05/04/17 KBH Prepare LMPD message, Telephone conference with . 1.1 302.50 
 

05/05/17 KBH Attention to Investigative File; Prepare for Interviews 0.7 192.50 

05/05/17 AS Review of interview summaries 0.8 220.00 

05/08/17 KBH Telephone Conference with ; Review PSU 3.2 880.00 
statements; Telephone conference with Mr. Sims; 
Telephone conference with Mr. DeSpain; Prepare for 
interviews 

05/08/17 AS Review of interview summaries 1.1 302.50 

05/09/17 KBH Attention to self insured trust matters 0.2 55.00 

05/10/1 7 KBH Telephone Conference with Mr. Golden; Review 0.4 110.00 
Investigative file 

05/16/17 KBH Prepare for Interview; Interview Major Flaherty; Telephone 7.6 2,090.00 
conference with  

05/16/17 AS Interview of Maj. Curtis Flaherty 6.8 1,870.00 

05/17/17 KBH Exchange messages with ; Review witness 1.4 385.00 
statements; Telephone conference with Ms. Hesen 

05/19/1 7 KBH Conference with Mr. Mason; Review interview notes 1.9 522.50 

05/19/17 AS Meeting with Clay Mason to discuss investigation and 1.5 412.50 
develop investigative plan 

05/22/17 KBH Telephone Conferences with Lt. DeSpain 0.3 82.50 

05/24/17 KBH Travel to Louisville; Conference with FBI; Review interview 2.8 770.00 
notes 

05/24/17 AS Travel to Louisville for meeting with FBI to discuss 2.5 687.50 
investigation 

05/27/17 KBH Telephone conference with Mr. James; Review media 0.6 165.00 
reports; Prepare file note 

I AGENT

FBI AGENT 

FBI AGENT 

FBI AGENT 

FB



IN ACCOUNT WITH 

~ D fC KI N SON(V\'RlG H TI'LLC 

LMPD MATTER 
CLIENT/MATTER N0.:074462-00001 

DATE INITIALS SERVICES 

05/31/17 KBH Review PIU materials; Review PSU Investigation 

05/31/17 AS Meeting with LMPD investigators/file review 

TOTAL FEES 

DATE DISBURSEMENTS 

04/28/17 TRAVEL EXPENSES MILEAGE- KERRY B. HARVEY 

05/16/17 TRAVEL EXPENSES MILEAGE - KERRY B. HARVEY 

05/24/17 TRAVEL EXPENSES MILEAGE- KERRY B. HARVEY 

TIMEKEEPER 

KERRY B. HARVEY 
ANDREW L. SPARKS 

TOTAL FEES CURRENT INVOICE 

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 

TOTAL CURRENT INVOICE 

TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY 

TITLE 

MEMBER 
OF COUNSEL 

. , WEST VINE ST REET, SU i rE 1700 

L~XINGTON, K y 4 0507 -1 621 

TELEP IIONE: (859) R99-8700 

h 11 p :// www. dick i nson wrigh l .co m 

FEDERAL J.D. 1138-1364333 

INVOICE DATE: JUNE 20, 2017 
INVOICE NO.: 1174013 
PAGE3 

HOURS VALUE 

6.4 1,760.00 

7.0 1,925.00 

51 .7 $ 14,217.50 

VALUE 

82.74 

82.74 

41 .67 

biOURS VALUE RATE 

275.00 
275.00 I 

I 

30.5 8,387.50 
21.2 5,830.00 

I 
51.7 $ 14,217.50 

o~0fr1 
~~~0 lt1 

N_Rj) ~ ~ 
$ tt 1; f AAtYYl IU 
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CITY OF LOUISVILLE 
527 WEST JEFFERSON 
4TH FLOOR 
LOUISVILLE, KY 40202 

CLI ENT/MATTER NO.: 074462-00001 

RE: LMPD MATTER 

-- -7--:-.~\ 
• 1 -
- ... , .. 

JUL l11uil 

PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH JUNE 30,2017 

W~ST VINE ST RE eT, SUI TE 1700 

L EX I NGTON, K Y 40507- 162 1 

T ELEPHONE: (859) 899-870 0 

h lip :1/w ww . di c k ins on wr i g h l . com 

FEDERAL J.D. #38-1364333 

INVOICE DATE: JULY 7, 2017 
INVOICE NO.: 1177591 

TOTAL FEES CURRENT INVOICE ............ . ................ ... .. .... ....... ... $ - 1-- _;.:_..:....:..c..::....::...._ 

TOTAL CURRENT INVOICE . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $ 

OUTSTANDING INVOICES ON THE MATTER BILLED ON THIS CURRENT INVOICE AS OF JULY 7. 2017 

INVOICE 

1174013 

DATE 

06/20/17 

BILLED VALUE 

14,424.65 

PAYMENTS 

(0.00) 

OUTSTANDING 

14,424.65 

TOTAL OUTSTANDING FROM PRIOR INVOICES..... . .. ...... ........ .. . . .. ........ $ 14,424.65 

SUBTOTAL AMOUNT DUE.. ................ ... . .. ..... . .... .......... . .. . . .. ... $ 18,604.65 

LESS PAYMENTS APPLIED. . ... . ... .. . ... .. . . . ... ....... . ...... . ... .. .. .. . . .. . . $ (495.00) 

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE . ..... . . ... . . . . .. .. ... . .. . . .. . . .. ...... ... . . ... . .. . . .. . . .. $ 18,109.65 
~~------

- Remittance Instructions -'-
***Terms: Due and Payable Upon Receipt*** 

Mail To: ACH Instructions: Wire Ins tructions: 
Dickinson Wright PLLC JP Morgan Chase Bank N.A. JP Morgan Chase Bank N.A. 
2600 W. Big Beaver 28660 Northwestern Highway 28660 Northwestern Highway 
Suite 300 Southfield, Ml 48034 Southfield, Ml 48034 
Troy, Ml 48084 ABA Number: 072 000 326 ABA Number: 021 000 021 

Account# 38852 Swift Code: CHASUS33 (International) 
Account# 38852 

. {Please Reference Invoice Numbers) (Please Reference Invoice Numbers) 



IN A CCOUNT WITH 

r:-:· 
D I CKIN SON~RI G HTPLLC 

• J W EST Vi NE STR EET, SUITE 1700 

L EXINGTON, KY 405 07 - 16 21 

TELEPIIONE: (859) 899 - 870 0 

h li p :1/w ww. d icki n s on w right.c om 

FEDERAL 1.0 . 1#38-1364333 

LMPD MATTER 
CLIENT/MATTER N0.:074462-00001 

INVOICE DATE: JULY 7, 2017 
INVOICE NO.: 1177591 

DATE INITIALS 

06/09/17 KBH 

06/09/17 AS 

06/16/17 1<8H 

06/1 7/1 7 KBH 

06/1 9/1 7 KBH 

06/19/1 7 AS 

06/23/17 KBH 

06/26/17 KBH 

06/27/17 KBH 

06/28/17 KBH 

06/29/1 7 KBH 

TIMEKEEPER 

' KERRY B. HARVEY 

ANDREW L. SPARKS 

CURRENT INVOICE DETAIL 

SERVICES 

Telephone conference with . ; Prepare for 
meeting ; Conference with Mr. Mason 

PAGE 2 

Meeting with investigator to discuss interviews/investigative 
plan 

Review investio~tive rerorts and rP.Iated messages 

Review PIU Investigative File 

Review witness statements; Telephone conference with . 
; Attention to Explorers' roster 

Call with FBI to discuss investigation developments 

Attention to messages; Review interview reports 

Attention to witness list and related information; Telephone 
conference with  

Review Flaherty and Gibson Interview notes; Arrange 
Burbrink interview 

Exchange messages with Mr. Mason; Telephone 
conference with potential witness 

Prepare for Interview; Conduct witness interview 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL CURRENT INVOICE 

TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY 

TITLE 

MEMBER 

OF COUNSEL 
275.00 
275.00 

TOTAL FEES CURRENT INVOICE 

HOURS VALUE 

2.2 605.00 

1.1 302.50 

2.3 632.50 

2.2 605.00 

1.6 440.00 

0.9 247.50 

0.5 137.50 

1.3 357.50 

0.6 165.00 

0.4 110.00 

2.1 577.50 

15.2 $ 4,180.00 

$ 4,180.00 

HOURS VALUE 

13.2 3,630.00 
2.0 550.00 

15.2 $ __ 4.;.:,•.;.;18;;.;;0.;.;:.0;.;,0-1 

FBI AGENT 

I AGENT

FBI AGENT   

FB
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' IN ACCOUNT WITH 

c 
DICKINSONrv-RIGHTruc 

CITY OF LOUISVILLE 
527 WEST JEFFERSON 
4TH FLOOR 
LOUISVILLE, KY 40202 

CLIENT/MATTER NO.: 074462-00001 

RE: LMPD MATTER 

W~ST V I NE STREET, SUITE 1700 

L EXINGTON, K Y 40507 - 1621 

T ELErHONE: (859) 899 -870 0 

http ://www. d ick insonwr ight.com 

FEDERAL !.D. #38-1 364333 

INVOICE DATE: AUGUST 4, 2017 
INVOICE NO.: 1184802 

·"' 

.. ~ ·· _, ....... · ·· -~· · 

PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL 

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES THROUGH JULY 31 , 2017 USD 

TOTAL FEES CURRENT INVOICE . ... . ....... . ............... . ............ ....... $ 1,402.50 
- ---'----

TOTAL CURRENT INVOICE.... . ..... . . . . ... . .. .. . .. .. . ......... . . . . .... . .. . . . .. $ 1,402.50 

OUTSTANDING INVOICES ON THE MATTER BILLED ON THIS CURRENT INVOICE AS OF AUGUST 4. 2017 

INVOICE 

1174013 
1177591 

DATE 

06/20/17 
07/07/17 

BILLED VALUE 

14,424.65 
4,180.00 

PAYMENTS 

(13,929.65) 
(495.00) 

OUTSTANDING 

495.00 
3,685.00 

TOTAL OUTSTANDING FROM PRIOR INVOICES. ......... . ... . .. . .................. $ 4,180.00 

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE .... .. ... . ............ . .. .. . . . . . ..... . .. .. .. .. ... ... . .. . .. $ 5,582.50 ___ .....;.. __ _ 

/10{ 2 2~ Sfo3o S0 3ooo SZ/~oj 

~·· ~ ~ . Remittance Instructions ~:-i 
~ 

***Terms: Due and Payable Upon Receipt*** 
Mail To: ACH Instructions: Wire Instructions: 

Dickinson Wright PLLC JP Morgan Chase Bank N.A. JP Morgan Chase Bank N.A. 
2600 W. Big Beaver 28660 Northwestern Highway 28660 Northwestern Highway 
Suite 300 Southfield, Ml 48034 Southfield, Ml 48034 
Troy, Ml 48084 ABA Number: 072 000 326 ABA Number: 021 000 021 

Account# 38852 Swift Code: CHASUS33 (International) 
Account# 38852 

(Please Reference Invoice Numbers) (Please Reference Invoice Numbers) 



IN A CCOUNT W ITH 

~ n ICKINSONrvRIGHTPLLC 

W EST V INE STREET, SUITE 1700 

LEXINGTON, KY 4 0507- 162 1 

TELEPHONE: (859 ) 899 -8700 

htt p:// www . d ic k in s o nwr ig ht . com 

FEDERAL J.D. #38-1 364333 

LMPD MATIER 
CLIENT/MATIER N0.:074462-00001 

INVOICE DATE: AUGUST 4, 2017 
INVOICE NO.: 1184802 

DATE INITIALS 

07/03/17 KBH 

07/07/17 AS 

07/12/1 7 KBH 

07/1 3/17 KBH 

07/1 8/17 KBH 

07/26/17 KBH 

07/28/17 KBH 

07/31/17 KBH 

TIMEKEEPER 

KERRY B. HARVEY 

ANDREW L. SPARKS 

PAGE2 

CURRENT INVOICE DETAIL 

SERVICES 

Review witness statement; Exchange messages with Mr. 
Mason 

Review LMPD investigative file - search warrant affidavits 
and interview statements 

Exchange messages with Mr. Mason; Review Indictment 

Telephone conference with reporter; Attention to LMPD 
document 

Telephone conference with Mr. Mosley: Attention to 
message from Mr. Mason; Review Interview notes 

Telephone conference with Mr. Mosely; Attention to 
messages from Mr. Mason 

Attention to messages from Mr. Mason: Conference with 
Mr. Sparks 

Attention to interview list; Exchange messages with law 
enforcement contact 

TOTAL FEES 

TOTAL CURRENT INVOICE 

TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY 

TITLE 

MEMBER 
OF COUNSEL 

RATE 

275.00 
275.00 

HOURS VALUE 

0.7 192.50 

1.4 385.00 

0.5 137.50 

0.4 110.00 

0.7 192.50 

0.6 165.00 

0.4 110.00 

0.4 110.00 

5.1 $ 1,402.50 

c$ 1,402.50 

HOURS VALUE 

3.7 1,017.50 

1.4 385.00 

TOTAL FEES CURRENT INVOiCE 5.1 $ 1,402.50 

.:f Eft= fY\os£y 

ot-c&ffYYI ~~~?)t? 
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I~VC.'ICE DATE: DECEMBER ·1 l. 20'17 
INVOICE NO .: 1?.169'! 1 

CIT ~' OF l..JUISVILLE 
527 'Ni:ST Jf:Fr-F.:RSCN 
4 r1-: :=Lom~ 
LU:.J:SVII .LE , KY t1 0202 

Pi"\!Vi!.i. GEU li/IJC CONi='iDE.'vT!Ai_ 

l:·oR ?POFESSIONAL SERVICES TH?.OUGH NOVEMBER 30, 2017 

TOT/I.l. r: r:;= s CURP.ENTII\IVO!CE . . . . ...... . .. . .... . ..... . .... .. . . . . . $ 

uso 
33,962.50 

'f,)T/11. l)iSBLm~: Ei•lit:NTS CURREJ·n I~N:)!C!::.. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . S ______ 4,407 .55 _ 

TO'!' AL CURI~I:.NT INVOlCE. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . $ 

11:1.'.-~~li.Cl~ Q.~TE J:iLIJ,E~P. .. .'£6JlJ_!;; PAYMf-NTS PUTSTAI'JDIJ::l§ 

1!'1·1013 Cf/~~ 0!1 '7 ·; 4,424.65 (13,929.65) 495.00 
11 03~55 09i!1 /17 18 '13:.i .50 (12,420 46) ____ , ____ ?.,Z..1},_0_4_ 

l CH.Il,L OU rST.t>.NOI~JC FROM PR!OR !NVOICE3 . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . S 

T!)Tt..l. AMCtUNT DUF...... ... . ....... . ..... . .. . .. . ........... . . .......... . .. ... $ 

38,370.05 

6,208.04 

44,578. 09 

I Remittance Instructions -j 

r~~r~i~~~;~~-=-==-~-=-~-~=-__ A-;H -;;~~~~~;;;?-~~fj!.~_Pa:ta bi~J!pon R ece~i~·~r.stn1cti:ns:-·---------l 
1--. f".'5icT<.ilsntl-r'Vri'fi'ii!PLL c·--·r T ]f>ifo~·uarl- c!i;:s-G BankN.A. --------··r-,, JP Morg•m cii6:~e Bank N.A. ____ _____ I 
' I 260·:) I'll. ~3ig Donv&r 1 i 28660 No: !trwestern highway 28660 Northwestern Highway 1 

! I ~:ui!1~ 300 

1

, ! Southfield, ,'.11 48034 I Soulhfie/rJ, Ml 48034 1 
! ; Tr~'Y /vi! 48iJti I I ABA Nurni:er: 072 000 326 I ! ABA Number: 021 000 021 J 

! i I ! .L:ccow,Tit 3Jii!32 j ! Sv;ift Cude. CJ-IASUS33 (!ntemational) j 
! j I : I Account# 38852 
I_ ___ .L .. _______ ___________ , _____ _j_j_[~~E:3Se R~'~Ef!~'!':!!.!!!.Y.I:'!.!;e Numbers) l__LJ?Iease Refer~flC!:_ Jny!?J.Ee Nl.!_'!'bers) .J 



. r:-: 
D I C KI N SON('IYRI G HT!'I. I ~: 

• Wr < ; \',~,i. Srkr.t·: . Sr:rrr !7(10 

l.r.v:,.,t:ror<. KY 4()507 - 1<>21 

Trr 1'1'1!0 '1.: 1~<•1; 899 -87(10 

LMPD MATTER 

h II p: I \\ \\ \ \ . \! i l' k j 11 ~ .. 1 n \\ rig. I; I , C 0 Ill 

FUlFRAI. Ill. •J8-136~J3> 

CLIENT/MATTER N0.:074462-0000 1 
INVOICE DATE: DECEMBER 11,2017 
INVOICE NO. : 1216911 
PAGE2 

CURRENT INVOICE DETAIL 

O.A.T£ INITIALS SERVICES HOURS VALUE 

09/01/17 K8H Telephone conference with Mr. Gibson; Review interview 2.6 715.00 
summaries; Conference with Mr. Sparks; Attention to 
litigation matters 

09/01 /17 f..S Review of LMPD interviews 6.0 1,650.00 

09i02/1"1 KSH Telephone conference with client: />.ttention to infomntion u 302.50 
from Mr. Mason 

09:•1Sti7 I<BH Review in!erview summaries 1.9 522.50 

09/05/"17 AS Review of LMPD investigative file 5.5 1,512.50 

09/06117 AS Review I.MPD investigative file 4.5 1.237 .50 

09107/1"1 AS Review of LMPD investigative file 1 0 275.00 

C9/07/17 I<BH Telepho11e conference with client 0.4 110.00 

09/08/17 KBH Attention to material from Mr. Mason 0.2 55.00 

08/08i1 7 AS Review of investigator's interviews/work on timeline 3.0 825.00 

09/ 11 /17 AS Review of investigative material 1.0 275.00 

09/12/17 KBH Prepare fo r interviews 2.2 605.00 

09!1 2/17 AS Prepare for inter1iews 1.0 275 00 
OS!! :}/17 .LI.S Conduct interviews in Louisvi!le 8.0 2,200.00 
Q(l/13/17 KBH Conduct witnP.ss ir:terviews 7.5 2,062.50 

09/14i17 I<BH ~-elephone .~onference with federal LEO; Telephone 0.6 165.00 
ccnfer.:)nce with Chief Conrad 

09120/17 AS Prepare list of fi11al interviews fo r investigator 0 .3 82.50 

09!22i17 I<BH Telephone ::onference with LMPO; Conference with Mr. 0.8 220.00 
Sparks: Attention to Interview Summaries 

09i22/17 AS Work on tlmeline 3.5 962.50 

09125117 .A.S Work on report 3.6 990.00 

08!26i17 f<:BH Tr: l<?.phor.e conference with ; Review interview 1.3 357.50 
summaries 

09i26/i7 AS Review of material/work on investigative report 7.3 2.007.50 
09/27/17 KBH Revie'l.l internal LMPD memoranda; Conference with Mr. 0.6 165.00 

Sparks 

09127117 AS Work on report 5.8 1,595.00 

09/28/17 AS Work on report 3.0 825.00 

09/29/i 7 KBH Telephone conference; Review memoranda 0.6 165.00 

09/29/1 7 AS Work on report 2.6 715.00 

10/04/1 7 AS Work on r"eport 4.0 1,100.00 

FBI AGENT



. /.--
0 JCKI N SON(/VRIGHTI'I.I C 

, \\' 1." V 1;. I S IIU E I , S I 'I'll: I 7 0 tl 

I I Xl'<l,"l ON, J( \' 40507 ·1 b21 

Tllo'I·IIOJ< I. : ( 859) S99-&700 

ht 1p·1: •.v '' w.Ci..:J..in~Oil\\ rig.h t . ..:um 

Ft:DFRAI I.D. "~N-136-13.1) 

LMPD M.A. TTER 
CLIENT/MATTER N0.:074462-00001 

INVOICE DATE: DECEMBER 11, 2017 
INVOICE NO : 1216911 
PAGE 3 

.Q.6.T.£ INITIALS SERVICES HOURS VALUE 

10/05/17 AS Work on !imelir.e 2.0 550.00 

10/10/17 AS Work on timeline 2.0 550.00 

10/1 1/17 AS Work on timeline 4.0 1,100.00 

10/12/17 AS Work en time!ine 3.0 825.00 

10/13/17 AS Work on timeline 1.0 275.00 

10/18/! 7 AS R~view oi material -· person.1el Illes and official records and 40 1 '100.00 
correspondence 

10/19/17 AS Work 011 timeline 4.0 1,100.00 

1 Q/20/17 .48 Work on tuneline/report 3.0 825.00 

10/22:17 AS Prepare memorandum; review and inventory of material to 1.5 41 2.50 
determir1e final steps necessary to complete internal 
investigation 

10/23117 KBH Review tirneline and related materials 1.8 495.00 

'10/23/1'7 A3 Work on report 4 .0 1,100.00 

1 C'/24/17 KBH Review interviews and ti111etine; Conference with clients 5.1 1.402 50 

1 0/24117 /\S Meeting in Louisville re : status of investigation and next 1.0 275.00 
steps 

10/24/17 P1S Work on report 0.5 137.50 

1 0125!1 7 KBH Confefence with Mr. sparks; Exchange messages with Mr. 0.5 137.50 
Mason 

10/25/17 /\S Work on repon 2.0 550.00 

10/30/17 KBH Conference with Mr. Mason 1.0 275.00 

10/30/17 /I.S Meei with investigator re: developments/next steps 1.3 357.50 

11/15/17 KBH Telephor:e conference wit[1 clie:nt; Prepare message to Mr. 1.1 302.50 
Mason; Re·.'iew complain! 

11/17/17 KBH Telephone conference with Mr. Kuhn 0.8 220.00 

TOTAL FEES 123.5 $ 33,962.50 

QATE DISBURSEMENTS VALUE 

09/13/17 TRAVEL EXPENSES PARKING .. KERRY B. HARVEY 10.00 
09/13/17 TRAVEL EXPENSES MILEAGE- KERRY B. HARVEY 83.56 
09/13/17 TRAVEL EXPENSES MILEAGE- ANDREW L. SPARKS 83.00 
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-------------------------- - - -------------------- --

LMPD MATTER 
CLIENT/MATTER N0.:0'144G2 -00001 

Q~,TE DI,SBUJ3.§_~MENJ.§ 

INVOICE DATE: DECEMBER 11. 20 17 
INVOICE NO.: 1216911 
PAGE4 

09t27/1 7 OTHER PROFESSIONALS INVESTIGATIVE SERVICES 8/16/17-9/22/17 

VALUE 

4,230.99 

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 

TOTAL CURRENT INVOICE 

---·---------· 
I TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY 

I TIMEKEEPER I -- -
I KERRY B. HARVEY MEMBER 

i /\~DREW L. SPARKS 

! 'YOTAL FEES CURRENT INVOICE 

OF COUNSEL 

i 

275.00 

275.00 

HOURS 

30.1 

93.4 

123.5 

$ 4 ,4 07 .55 

$ -~38;;.:•;;;..37;..;0;,;,. 0;;;,;5;....,... 

$ 

8, 277.50 

25 ,685.00 

33.962.50 
, ______ ________________ .. _______________________________________ ___, 




